
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Copies of your tree policies within the period October 2011 and October 2021 or where to locate said policies if readily accessible in electronic format

Please see attached.
2. A copy of your tree maintenance works carried out to the Hornbeam trees under your ownership and control, located to the front of the above Property between October 2011 and October 2021, pertaining to but not restricted to recommended works, extent of works completed and inspections;
Tree maintenance work records and site inspection records below for Hornbeam’s - T9 was located to the front of number 66/68 & T10 is located to the front of number 72. Tree plan is attached showing locations of T9 & T10.  
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3. A copy of your risk analysis in respect of Hornbeam trees between October 2011 and October 2021, to include any maintenance regimes, if any, also carried out within this period;
The public hazard risk rating for these trees is shown above in column O, along with maintenance inspection information.
4. Details of the information retained by and/or accessible to you in respect of the soil types in:
4.1 The Norman Street area


The council has no direct source information to the soil types in this area. Therefore, this is information not held.  Information on this can be determined if there are soil reports sent to the council linked to specific claims. Within the claim received for 70 Norman St the soil has been described as a soft to firm reddish-brown, dark grey/black slightly gravelly clay with rare sand and charcoal. The test results indicate a clay soil with a moderate capacity for volumetric change.
5. The number of tree related subsidence claims that have been brought against you within the LE3 postcode area and Norman Street between October 2011 and October 2021.  For each claim please confirm: 
· Location of the tree (by house number)
· Species of the implicated tree
· The date of the claim

The council does not record claims by postcode, and LE3 is such a wide area it would take a huge amount of time to manually search the records.  This is over the appropriate limit under FOI Act under section 12, or manifestly unreasonable under EIR Regulation 12(4)(b). We have searched for claims on Norman Street and hope that this is suitable.  

There are no actual subsidence claims submitted against the council, but we have had 4 mitigation requests.  These requests are to take action to prevent future damage to the risk address.

Location of the tree (by house number):
37 Norman Street

60 Norman Street

64 Norman Street

70 Norman Street

Species of the implicated tree:
37 Norman Street - Hornbeam

60 Norman Street – Silver Birch

64 Norman Street - Hornbeam

70 Norman Street - Ash

The date of the claim:
No claims have been made.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

