Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council does not hold the information requested.

You asked for:
1.How many cases were investigated by the Child Death Overview Panel in each of the last five years (2011/12, 2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15 and 2015/16). Please give a number for each year.
The Council does not hold this information. Referrals to the Child Death Overview Panel (CDOP) are usually made by the police or, in most cases, the NHS as per the CDOP protocol.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
2.In how many cases in each of the last five years were 'missed opportunities' or equivalent identified in terms of the child's contact with an NHS provider, or NHS-contracted provider? Please give a number for each year.

3.In how many cases referred to in question 2 were there 'missed opportunities' identified relating to a child's contact with an Urgent Care Centre?

In response to questions 2 and 3, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may wish to redirect your request to:
http://www.leicspart.nhs.uk/_InformationLibrary-NewPage.aspx
4.Please provide basic details of each case referred to in question (3). I appreciate the details will need to be anonymised/redacted as necessary in order to prevent identification. 

Again, this information is not held by Leicester City Council and this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

