Freedom of Information Act 2000 – wheelchair accessible accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:
1.
How many council owned wheelchair accessible properties are there in total in your local authority area? i.e. combined number of properties that are occupied and unoccupied. 

Occupied:

86 in total with 1 currently void 
75 x General Needs

9 x Sheltered

1 x Supported living

                              

Void

1 x Sheltered flat
                    

a.    What standard is your local authority using for determining if the property is wheelchair accessible? 

A fully wheelchair accessible property will have level access into and throughout the property. This may be a ground floor property or a property with access via a lift, stair lift or through floor lift. It will have widened doors to allow wheelchair users to access rooms as necessary within the property and will have level access bathing facilities.

2.
What is your area’s policy for providing temporary accommodation for applicants who require wheelchair accessible accommodation? 

 

a. 
If there is no written policy, could you please provide information as to what your area might do in these types of situations?  

There is no written policy. If we have an applicant who requires temporary accommodation that is wheelchair accessible, then this will be provided. To not do so would amount to discrimination on the grounds of disability. It is for the authority to provide suitable temporary accommodation as there is a duty owed under the homeless legislation.  

 

3.      How many applicants requiring a wheelchair accessible property are on your waiting list? 

As at 01/04/2017 there were 139 households on the Housing Register requiring fully wheelchair accessible accommodation.

4.      How many unoccupied wheelchair accessible properties are there currently available for bidding in your local authority area?        

There are 2 fully wheelchair adapted properties in this week’s cycle which closes Monday 15th

5.      Does your local authority operate a policy whereby people registering on your Housing Register must have lived within the local authority area for a minimum period of time?

All applicants applying to join the Housing Register must meet the Leicester City Requirement (local connection criteria). 

a.      If yes, how long is this period? 

Applicants must be living in the City for the past two years or, 3 years out of the last 5 years.

6.    How many people were registered as homeless or required homeless-ness prevention in your local authority area in the past 3 years, and of those how many were disabled people with a long term health condition? (please break down by year)

	
	2014-15

	2015-16

	2016-17

	Comments/Definitions


	Registered as Homeless
	108
	129
	100
	Registered as homeless = made a homeless application and was found to be: eligible, unintentionally homeless and in priority need

	Disabled with a long term health condition and registered as homeless
	Data not available*

	Prevention from Homelessness
	1704
	2454
	3364
	Prevention figures 

	Disabled with a long term health condition and prevented from becoming homeless
	Data not available*


*The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
