Freedom of Information Act 2000 – home-care agency fees 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:
1. Whether the council has paid a private agency or agencies to provide at-home-care for the elderly and/or infirm within the last 12 month period for which information is available.

Answer: We have a domiciliary care framework of 15 providers in which they provide care and support to service users.

2. Details of which agency/agencies were used during the last 12 month
period for which information is available.

Carewatch Care Services Limited (Previously Always There Homecare Ltd) 

Amicare Domiciliary Care Services

Danbury Gardens - Help at Home (previously Mears Homecare Danbury Gardens)

Aspire UK (City & County Care Services T/A Aspire UK)

Choices Care Ltd

Direct Health (UK) Limited

Domiciliary Care Services (UK) Limited

Hales Group Ltd

Help at Home

Ark Home Healthcare (previously Housing & Care 21)

Help at Home (previously Mears Care Ltd)

Private Home Care UK LTD

Sevacare UK Ltd

Universal Care Services (UK) Limited

Westminster Homecare Limited

3. How much money was paid to each agency/agencies in fees during the
last 12 month period for which information is available?

	Domiciliary Care Provider
	total amount paid for 2016/2017

	ABUNDANT LIFE CARE LTD
	£665.00

	Advance Housing & Support Ltd
	£644.16

	Age UK Leicester Shire and Rutland  Home Help Ltd
	£1,098.33

	Always There Homecare Ltd
	£657,321.46

	Amicare Domiciliary Services Ltd
	£1,548,030.73

	Ark Home Healthcare Ltd
	£820,085.79

	Aspire UK
	£2,915,403.70

	Asra Housing Group T/a Compass Care
	£61,870.86

	Choices Care Ltd
	£315,857.79

	Creative Support Ltd
	£5,079.53

	Danbury Gardens - Help at Home
	£660,481.83

	Direct Health UK Ltd
	£395,503.96

	Domiciliary Care Services UK Ltd
	£1,018,621.47

	Hales Group Ltd
	£128,963.83

	Help At Home
	£533,276.41

	Help at Home (Previously Mears Care Ltd)
	£130,990.58

	NHS Leicester City CCG
	£49,353.87

	Private Home Care UK Ltd FA SL&FSB
	£220,397.53

	Select Care Services
	£2,087.07

	Sevacare (UK) Ltd
	£666,746.40

	Storm Homecare Ltd
	£21,964.08

	Universal Care Services (UK) Ltd
	£385,362.52

	Venetia House
	£1,857.60

	LuWestminster Homecare Ltd 
	£1,200,285.72


4. What proportion of the total cost to the customer these fees
represented (if known)
Q4 rephrasing: Of the money paid by the customer for the specified care services, what proportion amounted to the fees charged by the private agency contracted by the council?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

