Freedom of Information Act 2000 and Environmental Information Regulations Act 2004

Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
Collecting garden waste:
1. Do you charge for collection of garden / green waste?
Yes.

2. If you do charge, how much do you charge for this in the financial year 17/18? 3. What service to they get for this charge? e.g. are there restrictions such as the number of bags?
£40 per bin by direct debit, £45 by other payment methods for a 240 litre bin. Additional bins are £20 per bin per year.

4. If you charge for garden waste collection, what year did you start to do this?
2014. There was no dedicated collection service for garden waste prior to this.

5. What months do you offer a garden waste collection?
March-November.

6. How often is garden waste collected?
Fortnightly.

7. What is the total number of households, and percentage of households, where garden waste is collected?
Total dwelling stock: 133,620. Garden waste collected from 4,100 properties. 3.1% take up. Many properties in the City do not require a garden waste service e.g. flats, terraces with backyards etc. 

8. Are there any additional garden waste charges (e.g. Christmas trees disposal)?
No.

Composting:
9. Do you compost the collected garden waste?
Our contractor is responsible for the treatment and disposal of our garden waste and has chosen to have the waste treated at a farm/composting site. The waste is composted by the farm and then used on their land.

10. If so, what percentage do you sell this back to the public, and at what price? Please include details of the weight of the compost for this price.
Not applicable.
11. If so, what percentage do you use for public grounds and gardens? What is the value of this to you in the most recent financial year you have the data for?
Not applicable.

12. Are there any additional sources of income from collected garden waste?
No.

Total costs (Forecast 17/18 and actual 16/17):
13. What is the cost to you each year of collecting and disposing of garden waste?
The information you have requested is not held, the cost of the treatment of garden waste forms part of a much wider contract for waste and recycling in the City.  There are other costs involved such as the administration of the service, this is embedded in other work of the Service Development Team and not held as a separate figure.
Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, because, in accordance with section 1.1; this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 

The following exception is also applicable under the Environmental Information Regulations, reg.12 (4) (a) Leicester City Council does not hold the information requested.
14. How much did you make from any collection charges and sale to the public of composted waste?

The Council made no profit.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

