Freedom of Information Act 2000 – child protection
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
Can you please supply the following information regarding referrals etc. to children’s social care or its predecessor for two cohorts of children? Children born in the year from 1st April 2011  to 31st March 2012, before their fifth birthday and separately children born in the year from 1st April 2006 to 31st March 2007 also before their fifth birthday:
1.
How many children had ever been referred

2.
How many referrals were made on these children

3.
How many children had started an episode as a child in need

4.
How many children had ever been subject of a section 47 enquiry

5.
How many children had ever been subject of a child protection plan (or placed on a child protection register)

6.
For those children placed on a child protection plan/register the category of abuse allocated at the start of the first plan/registration

7.
How many children had ever been looked after

8.
How many looked after children had left care to be adopted 

9.
What was the legal status of looked after children born 1st April 2011 to 31st March 2012 at 31st March 2017 and for children born 1st April 2006 to 31st March 2007 at 31st March 2012

Questions 1, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8 & 9 are counts of individual children whilst question 2 asks for the number of referrals made on children in this cohort. For questions 4 & 5 include children placed on the register prior to their birth should be included.

Answer: 
Please see information in the attached spreadsheet.

The Council does not hold information for the year 2006-07 in relation to Q3.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

