Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Children’s data protocols
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
The request relates to assessments carried out by the local authority to assess whether a child is ‘in need’ and owed a duty by the local authority under s17 of the Children Act 1989.

1.
Please provide all documents, procedures, policies and / or protocols relating to data protection and information sharing held by the local authority in relation to assessments and support for families. 

Answer:
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain i.e. the Council’s website.

The Council’s Information Governance and Risk Policy can be accessed via the following link:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/ 

Information Sharing:
The Council’s Information Sharing Agreement register is located at: 
http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/how-we-use-information-about-you/
Information sharing protocols and agreement templates are located at: http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/how-we-use-information-about-you/partner-tools/
2. 
Please confirm whether the LA consider that information obtained in a Children Act 1989 assessment is sensitive personal data as set out in section 2 of the Data Protection Act 1998?

This is technically information not held under the FOI Act. You have not asked for information held but an opinion. It will depend on the exact nature of the data collected. This could be different in every individual case, depending on what is recorded.
Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. 
What is the protocol to ensure confidential information is kept private when a Home Office worker attends a Children Act assessment?
See Information Governance and Risk Policy in Q1

4. 
Please confirm whether the LA routinely seek consent from children/parents before sharing any information obtained in a Children Act assessment with the Home Office? Please provide all consent pro formas used for this purpose.
The Council does not seek specific parental consent following a request of information from Home Office. 

5. 
At the stage of seeking consent, are parents/children told that they can refuse consent, and of the consequences of refusal? Please confirm what is told to the parents / children. If there is a written document provided to them, please provide this to us. If not, please set out what it is that parents and children are told.
Not applicable

6. 
If consent is refused what are the consequences? 
Not applicable

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

