Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked for:
1.       According to the National Drug Treatment Monitoring System (NDTMS) data, how many opiate clients were in treatment between 31st March 2016 and 1st April 2017? 

Data from the National Drug Treatment Monitoring System (NDTMS) is currently restricted for the period 2016-17 and therefore this information is exempt as it is intended for future publication in line with S22 of the Act.  This letter acts as S17 refusal notice in respect of this part of your request.

2. According to the Office for National Statistics (ONS) and/or Coroners statistics, how many deaths related to drug poisoning (as defined by the International Classification of Diseases, ICD-9 and ICD-10) were registered in 2015 where any opioid was mentioned on the death certificate? 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
                                                                                                       

3. Is Take-home Naloxone (THN) currently provided? If THN is currently provided, please proceed to respond to Questions 4-14. 

Yes. 
4. Was the term ‘Naloxone’ specifically included in the most recent tender document when commissioning for any drug and/or alcohol services? 
Yes. This is one important part of our approach to tackling Drug Related Deaths. 
5. Who is responsible for purchasing Naloxone? 

The commissioned provider, at present this is Turning Point. 

6. How many Naloxone kits were purchased by responsible persons/bodies (see Question 5) in each financial year since 2014/15?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

7. Are there any concrete plans to repurchase Naloxone in the next financial year (between 1st April 2017 and 31st March 2018)? 

Yes, the amount will be decided by the commissioned provider dependent on predicted need. Take home Naloxone is actively promoted. Awareness of the kits will be actively promoted during recovery week on 1st – 8th September 2017. 

8. Who is currently directly providing Take-home Naloxone (THN) kits? 

Take home Naloxone is available in hospitals (A&E), needle exchange services, from homeless outreach services, hostels, prison and the main treatment provider premises.  

9. Have THN providers received training on how to train THN recipients to administer Naloxone? If such training has been provided, please proceed to respond to sub-questions a-b. 
Yes

a. Which groups received such training?  
Police, treatment workers, pharmacists, peer mentors, housing/outreach workers, peers, friends & family.   

b. Which organisation(s) and/or individual(s) delivered such training? 
The main training provider is Turning Points clinical team. 
10. Who is currently provided with THN kits? 

Users of treatment services, Family/friends/carers of people who use opiates, People who use opiates (not in treatment), housing/outreach workers, police, pharmacists, A&E staff. 

11. Do individuals eligible to receive THN kits (see Question 11) have to fulfil any requirements in order to receive THN kits? 
No apart from taking part in a simple training session about  how to use it. 

12. What is the maximum number of THN kits an individual can receive at the point of access, if any? 

2 (1 spare/back up kit). 

13. How many THN kits were dispensed in the community in each financial year since 2014/15?
2014-15 = Naloxone was not issues during this period

2015-16 = 260 (this is based on 56 issued by LRP and 102 service users receiving it from LiFT). 

2016-17 = 104 YTD – October 2016 to March 2017. 

14. What recording and/or monitoring practices have been put in place regarding Naloxone, if any? 
THN is reported quarterly by the provider as part of LCCs contract monitoring processes. Internally the commissioned provider will have their own processes in place

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

