Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Children in Need 16 and 17 and other vulnerabilities

Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. In your local authority area how many children aged 16 and 17 were a) children in need (including children on child protection plan); b) looked after children on 31 March 2017?

	
	a) Children in need 
	b) Children on child protection plan 
	c) Looked after children 

	Aged 16
	41
	13
	58

	Aged 17
	21
	4
	69


2. In your local authority area how many children aged 16 and 17 were a) children in need (including children on child protection plan); b) looked after children at any point in the year from 1 April 2016 to 31 March 2017?

	
	a) Children in need 
	b) Children on child protection plan 
	c) Looked after children 

	Aged 16
	298
	37
	60

	Aged 17
	481
	31
	145


3. In your local authority area: 

	
	How many children aged 16 and 17 on 31 March 2017 were in:
	How many Children in need, including children on child protection plans aged 16 and 17 on 31 March 2017 were in:
	How many looked after children

children aged 16 and 17 on 31 March 2017 were in:

	Full time education


	7328
	199
	48

	Work based learning 
	198
	19
	8

	Employer funded training 
	256
	7
	1

	Other education and training 
	40
	8
	2

	Not in education or training – in employment 
	196
	10
	2

	Not in employment, education or training 
	403
	72 
	19


4. In your local authority area: 

	
	On 31 March 2017 how many children aged 17 had achieved the following in GCSE or equivalent: 


	On 31 March 2017 how many children in need, including children on child protection plans

 aged 17 had achieved the following in GCSE or equivalent: 


	On 31 March 2017 how many looked after children aged 17 had achieved the following in GCSE or equivalent: 



	No passes


	We do not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.



	No passes above grade D

 
	

	No passes at any grade in at least one of English or Maths


	

	Not obtaining at least 5 passes  at any grade including English and Math


	


5. In your local authority area: 

	
	How many of 16 and 17 year olds who were children in need, including children on child protection plans, at any point from 1 April 2016 to 31 March 2017 were: 


	How many of 16 and 17 year olds who were looked after children at any point from 1 April 2016 to 31 March 2017 were:

	Arrested at any point in their lives


	Arrest data is not held by Local Authority.  This is a refusal in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act



	Received an Anti-social behavioural order (ASBO) at any point in their lives
	None
	None


6. How many young adults currently aged 18 to 20 in your local authority area were: 

We do not have a comprehensive list of 18-20 year-old residents. Therefore this is a refusal under section 1.1 of the Act.
We can show those that would be of that age and were Child Protection / Looked after Children at 16-17 but cannot guarantee they are still in the area. We cannot calculate the Children In Need cohort

	A Child in Need when aged 16 or 17


	

	A child on Child Protection Plan when aged 16 or 17


	0

	Looked after child when aged 16 or 17 


	23



7. How many young adults aged 18-20 claimed housing benefit at any point from 1 April 2016 to 31 March 2017?  

	502


How many of these young adults were at any point:

i. Children in need, including children on child protection plans when they were 16 or 17?
	This is a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.




ii. Looked after children when they were 16 or 17?
	As above, this information is not held by the Council


8. How many young adults aged 18-20 presented as homeless to the local authority at any point from 1 April 2016 to 31 March 2017? 

	 145


How many of these were, at any point:

i. Children in need, including children on child protection plans when they were 16 or 17:

	0  (as stated in 6 above, we cannot calculate the Children in Need cohort, therefore only checked against Child Protection plan cohort)


ii. Looked after children when they were 16 or 17:

	11



9. How many of young adults aged 18-20 were NEET (not in education, employment or training) at any point from 1 April 2016 to 31 March 2017? 

	We do not collect data for all 18-20 year olds, only for those with Education, Health and Care Plan.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

 


How many of these young adults were, at any point:

i. Children in need, including children on child protection plans when they were 16 or 17:

	As above


ii. Looked after children when they were 16 or 17:
	As above


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

