Freedom of Information Act 2000 – adult social care housing 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
Due to requesting this information nationally we have revised the questions asked to gain further clarification and to allow us to ask clear questions that should yield better results than the previous questions
Please may I request the following information:

Answer: 

The terminology that Leicester City Council uses to define the services we offer differs from the definition you have provided. We have explained this within our response below:

Assisted Living - We call this Independent Living Support - Supported Housing which is a non-regulated service and can be in either shared accommodation or in apartments. The support is to achieve resettlement, reduce the risk of losing the accommodation, provide help and support in acquiring the skills to maintain and retain independence. Please note that this does not include Extra Care

By Supported Living we mean schemes that provide personal care to people as part of the support that they need to live in their own homes. The personal care is provided under separate contractual arrangements to those for the person’s housing. The accommodation is often shared, but can be single household. 

OLDER PEOPLE

1. 
How many older people need residential care homes within your Local Authority?

As at 31-08-2017, there are 895 older people in residential homes within the Local Authority Area. 

2. 
How many older people need assisted living within your Local Authority?

As at 31-08-2017, there are 12 older people (aged 65+) currently in receipt of an Independent Living Support – Supported Housing service, within the Local Authority Area.

3. 
How many older people need supported living within the Local Authority?

As at 31-08-2017, there are 42 older people (aged 65+) with supported living within Leicester City Council

4. 
What percentage of those living in elderly residential care homes/assisted living/supported living do you place within the Local Authority area?

Residential Homes – 796 / 895 = 89%

Supported Living – 35 / 42 = 83%

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing – We do not currently hold data that accounts for the location of an ILS – Supported Housing Placement, and therefore we cannot respond to this element of the request.  Therefore this is a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.
5. 
What percentage of those living in elderly residential care homes/assisted living/supported living do you place outside the Local Authority area?

Residential Homes – 99 / 895 = 11%

Supported Living – 7 / 42 = 17%

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing – We do not currently hold data that accounts for the location of an ILS – Supported Housing Placement, and therefore we cannot respond to this element of the request. This is a refusal notice under section 1.1 of the Act, information not held 
6. 
Would it be right to say that it is the council’s preference to place older people within the borough?

Yes

7. 
Would it be right to say that the existing provisions are adequate for the needs of the older people within the borough?

No, there is still shortage of extra care and insufficient provision for night time care in the community. 

8. 
In respect of older people, how many of the placements are within private provisions?

Residential Homes – 100%

Supported Living – 100%

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing – 100%

9. 
In respect of older people, how many of the placements are within the council’s own provisions?

None

ADULTS WITH DISABILITIES

1. 
How many adults with learning disabilities need residential care homes within your Local Authority?

As at 31-08-2017, there are 259 adults with learning disabilities in residential homes within Leicester City Council.

2. 
How many adults with learning disabilities need assisted living within your Local Authority?

As at 31-08-2017, there are 17 adults with learning disabilities that need Independent Living Support – Supported Housing within Leicester City Council

3. 
How many adults with learning disabilities need supported living within the Local Authority?

As at 31-08-2017, there are 215 adults with learning disabilities that receive supported living within Leicester City Council.

4. 
What percentage of those living in adults with learning disabilities residential care homes/assisted living/supported living do you place within the Local Authority area?

Residential care homes – 183 / 259 = 71%

Supported living – 158 / 215 = 73%

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing – We do not currently hold data that accounts for the location of an ILS – Supported Housing Placement, and therefore we cannot respond to this element of the request.  This is a refusal notice under section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council.
5. 
What percentage of those living in adults with learning disabilities residential care homes/assisted living/supported living do you place outside the Local Authority area?

Residential Homes – 76 / 259 = 29%

Supported Living – 57 / 215 = 73%

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing – 27%

6. 
Would it be right to say that it is the council’s preference to place adults with learning disabilities within the borough?

Yes

7. 
Would it be right to say that the existing provisions are adequate for the needs of the adult with learning disabilities within the borough?

Yes, although more specialist provision would need to be looked at in a wider field where required e.g. complex challenging behaviour or association with educational placement outside of the borough.

8. 
In respect of adults with learning disabilities, how many of the placements are within private provisions?

Residential Homes – 100%

Supported Living – 100% 

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing) – 100%

9. 
In respect of adults with learning disabilities, how many of the placements are within the council’s own provisions?

Residential Homes – 0%

Supported Living – 0%

Independent Living Support - Supported Housing – 0%

What we mean by residential care home, assisted living, or supported living is the following:

Residential Care Home

Assisted Living - 24 hour supported living (small group living together with 24 hour

support)

Supported Living - Individuals living individually but in a block of apartments, where there is support available within the block either 24 hours a day, or during the day (but not overnight)

HOMELESS

1. 
Would it be right to say that it is the council’s preference to place homeless within the borough?
Yes

2. 
Would it be right to say that the existing provisions are adequate for the needs of the homeless within the borough?

Yes, although more specialist provision such as refuges would need to be looked at in a wider field where required, for example when it is not safe within the borough
3. 
In respect of the homeless, how many of the placements are within private provisions?

4. 
In respect of the homeless, how many of the placements are within the council’s own provisions?

We would require the most up to date statistics of homelessness in your area that fits your criteria for those to be temporarily rehoused for example:

having no accommodation at all

having accommodation that is not reasonable to live in, even in the short-term (eg because of violence or health reasons) Those who are unintentionally homeless.

With respect to Qs3 - 4 above, Local Authorities have to provide figures (P1E) on the activity within their area in relation to the homelessness functions on a quarterly basis to central government who make this available in a public document; please see the hyperlink: 

https://www.gov.uk/government/statistical-data-sets/live-tables-on-homelessness
This therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

