Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Discretionary Housing Payments (DHPs)  
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked for:
For all of the following, we would like to request data for the year 2016/17 (The twelve months between the beginning of April 2016 and the end of March 2017). Please complete all of the fields that you can.

A All applicants

All DHP applications and awards
1.     The total discretionary housing payment (DHP) budget available to your local authority for the 2016/17 financial year [please include, and specify, any additional funds granted].

Answer:  £780,900 Budget

          

2.     The amount spent or committed on DHPs at the end of the year 2016/17.

All of the above 

          

3.     The number of applications for DHP received by your local authority in the year 2016/17.

2,387 

          

4.     The number of applications refused.

992
Length of time of award
5.     The average length of time a DHP award was given for in 2016/17

154 days

Repeat applicants (if recorded)
6.     The number of applications received where the applicant had previously received a DHP from your authority

407

7.     The number of applications refused where the applicant had previously received a DHP from your authority

Data not recorded. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

B Applicants affected by the benefit cap

DHP applications and awards
8.
The number of applications received from applicants who had their benefits reduced by the household benefit cap

147
9.
The number of applications refused to applicants who had their benefits reduced by the household benefit cap.

10.
The number of applications refused to applicants who had their benefits reduced by the household benefit cap and had previously received a DHP award by your local authority (if recorded).

With regards to Qs.9 and 10 above, data is not recorded, therefore this is a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Length of time of award for benefit cap affected households

11.
The average length of time a DHP awarded to households affected by the benefit cap was given for in 2016/17

93 days

12.
The number of DHPs awarded to households affected by the benefit cap given for the different time periods listed

a. Less than 4 weeks (includes one-off payments)
27
b. 4 weeks to 12 weeks
73
c. Between 12 weeks and 26 weeks
30
d. Between 26 weeks and 52 weeks
15
e. More than 52 weeks
2
Applicants affected by the benefit cap who are single parents with dependent children aged 0 or 1 year’s old (if recorded)

13.
The number of applications received where the applicant was impacted by the benefit cap and was a single parent with dependent children aged 0 or 1 years old (if recorded).

14.
The number of applications refused where the applicant was impacted by the benefit cap and was a single parent with dependent children aged 0 or 1 years old (if recorded).

15.
The number of applications refused where the applicant was impacted by the benefit cap and was a single parent with dependent children aged 0 or 1 years old, and had previously received a DHP award (if recorded).

With regards to Qs.13-15, this data is not recorded. This is therefore a refusal in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council
C
Discretionary Housing Payment’s allocation policy
16. Your most recent Discretionary Housing Payments policy document, setting out the procedures in place for determining DHP awards

See attached PDF

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

