Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Please let me have the following information in respect of your Borough in the calendar years April 2017 to October 2017 & April 2016 to October 2016:

The number of:

1. Fixed Penalty Notices issued for littering
· 01/04/2016 to 01/10/2016 = 148

· 01/04/2017 to 01/10/2017 = 201

2. Fixed Penalty Notices paid for littering
· 01/04/2016 to 01/10/2016 = 107 Paid In Full

· 01/04/2017 to 01/10/2017 = 144 Paid In Full

3. Prosecutions made for non-payment of Fixed Penalty Notices for littering
· 01/04/2016 to 01/10/2016 = 8 prosecutions

· 01/04/2017 to 01/10/2017 =  6 prosecutions  

(Please include FPNs issued for other offences such as dog fouling separately)
	FPN’s Issued 01/04/2016 to 01/10/2016

	OFFENCE
	No.

	Allowing person to smoke in a Smoke-free Premise/Vehicle
	1

	Breaching Requirement of a Dog Control Order Permitting Dog to Enter Land Excluding Dogs
	1

	Breaching Requirement of a Community Protection Notice
	29

	Breaching Requirement of  a Notice in Respect to Commercial Waste Receptacles
	11

	Breaching Requirement of Notice in Respect to Domestic Waste Receptacles
	58

	Distribution of Free Printed Matter on Designated Land
	13

	Failing to Furnish Documents Requested
	25

	Fly Posting
	1

	Fly Tipping
	14

	Graffiti
	1

	Leaving Litter
	148

	Nuisance Parking
	14

	Smoking in a Smoke-free Premise/Vehicle
	23


	FPN’s Issued 01/04/2017 to 01/10/2017

	OFFENCE
	No.

	Allowing person to smoke in a Smoke-free Premise/Vehicle
	4

	Breaching Requirement of a Dog Control Order Permitting Dog to Enter Land Excluding Dogs
	2

	Breaching Requirement of a Dog Control Order Failed to Remove Faeces
	1

	Breaching Requirement of Community Protection Notice
	16

	Breaching Requirement of Notice in Respect to Commercial Waste Receptacles
	14

	Breaching Requirement of Notice in Respect to Domestic Waste Receptacles
	104

	Distribution of Free Printed Matter on Designated Land
	2

	Failed to Display a No-Smoking sign in a Smoke-free Premise/Vehicle
	1

	Failing to Furnish Documents Requested
	68

	Failing to furnish Waste Carriers License
	6

	Fly Tipping
	18

	Leaving Litter
	201

	Nuisance Parking
	6

	PSPO Failed to Put or Keep Dog on Lead
	1

	PSPO Failed to Remove Faeces
	17

	PSPO Permitting Dog to Enter Land Excluding Dogs
	3

	Smoking in a Smoke-free Premise/Vehicle
	22


4. Litter Abatement Notices under S92 of the Environmental Protection Act (EPA) issued
This legislation was revoked by ASB Crime And Policing Act 2014, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Street Litter Control Notices (EPA S93 & 94) issued
This legislation was revoked by ASB Crime And Policing Act 2014, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6. Litter Clearance Notices (EPA S92A) issued.

This legislation was revoked by ASB Crime And Policing Act 2014, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

