Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered. 
You asked for:
Area 1 – Volume of Contracting and use of PQQs / SQs

For each of the Financial Years indicated below, please provide figures for:

a)      The total number of works contracts awarded by your authority, which had a value between £25,000 and the OJEU standard goods and services threshold (nominally £164k)

and: 

b)      The number of these procurements in which a separate shortlisting phase (i.e. using a PQQ or SQ to form a shortlist before proceeding to a final tender stage) was used.

	Year
	2013-14
	2014-15
	2015-16
	2016-17



	a) – Number of WORKS contracts in range
	22 captured in Contracts Database 
	49 captured in Contracts Database
	58 captured in Contracts Database
	46 captured in Contracts Database

	b) – Number of these in which a PQQ stage was used
	0
	0
	0
	0


Area 2 – Speed of procurement

For each of the Financial Years indicated, for works contracts valued between £25,000 and the OJEU standard goods and services threshold (nominally £164k), please indicate:

c)  The average time it took from the date on which the contract was advertised (or tenders / quotations sought if non-advertised process), to the date on which the contract was awarded to the winner.

	Year
	2013-14
	2014-15
	2015-16
	2016-17



	c) – Average time from advert to award (in days)


	* Not available without significant effort being needed for this period
	Small sample only available (5) gives 32 Days from Advert Go Live to the Award/Completion Date captured for these
	Sample of over 10 gives 34 Days from Advert Go Live to the Award/Completion Date captured for these
	Sample of over 10 gives 45 Days from Advert Go Live to the Award/Completion Date captured for these


	NOTE: With specific regard to this item, the researcher is aware that not all authorities may hold this information or be able to compile it easily.

For the purposes of the research, figures for one financial quarter, or a representative sample of at least 10 works contracts, would be acceptable. Please indicate if your data is based on either approach.




* This is a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of Section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.
Area 3 – SME’s winning business

Note that this question is now concerned with all spend, not just the works category.

For each of the Financial Years indicated, please indicate:

d)  Your authority’s total third-party spend on goods, works and services,

e)  The proportion (either as a monetary figure, or a % ) of that spend which was with SME suppliers

f) The number of procured contracts (irrespective of value or category) won by SMEs.

	Year
	2013-14
	2014-15
	2015-16
	2016-17



	d) – Total third party spend


	£320,146,537 as per prior data extraction completed for this year
	£346,775,701 as per Management Reporting for this year
	£281,166,266 as per Management Reporting for this year
	£191,426,504 as per Management Reporting for this year

	e) – SME spend as a proportion of total


	** Unable to state – stats collection not in place at this time
	** Unable to state – stats collection not in place at this time
	£64,345,476 of Procurement Spend flagged as SME as per the Management Reporting for this year
	£34,717,844 of Procurement Spend flagged as SME as per the Management Reporting for this year

	f) – Number of contracts won by SMEs
	95 captured in Contracts Database (although the Database may not have a full capture of all the Contracts from this period)
	127 captured in Contracts Database
	102 captured in Contracts Database
	172 captured in Contracts Database


** The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall, 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

