Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Disabled Children

Your request for information has now been considered.  The Council holds the following information.
You asked:
Question 1: What was the Council’s gross expenditure on social care services for i) children and ii) disabled children under Section 17 of the Children Act 1989 in the following years: 2010/11; 2011/12; 2012/13; 2013/14; 2014/15; 2015/16 and 2016/17?
Answer:
Financial Year

Children


Disabled Children





£



£

2010/11


4,886,600


2,223,300

2011/12


4,792,700


1,538,800

2012/13


5,063,800


1,397,900

2013/14


4,437,700


1,559,000

2014/15


6,810,800


1,528,900

2015/16


8,924,300


1,412,100

2016/17


8,923,600


1,513,100

Question 2: Of gross expenditure on social care services for disabled children in 2016/17, please provide a breakdown by primary support need (as listed in the table below) and the number of children to receive social care by those categories:

 

	 
	Gross expenditure on social care services for disabled children (2016/2017) (£)
	Number of disabled children

	Behaviour
	 
	 

	Communication
	 
	 

	Consciousness
	 
	 

	Autism/Asperger's
	 
	 

	Hand function
	 
	 

	Hearing
	 
	 

	Incontinence
	 
	 

	Learning
	 
	 

	Mobility
	 
	 

	Personal care
	 
	 

	Vision
	 
	 

	Other (DDA)
	 
	 

	Total
	 
	 


Question 3: Please highlight the mean, lower and upper quartile cost of providing social care services for disabled children in each of the primary support need areas.   
	 
	Mean cost (£)
	Lower quartile (£)
	Upper quartile (£)

	Behaviour
	 
	 
	 

	Communication
	 
	 
	 

	Consciousness
	 
	 
	 

	Autism/Asperger's
	 
	 
	 

	Hand function
	 
	 
	 

	Hearing
	 
	 
	 

	Incontinence
	 
	 
	 

	Learning
	 
	 
	 

	Mobility
	 
	 
	 

	Personal care
	 
	 
	 

	Vision
	 
	 
	 

	Other (DDA)
	 
	 
	 


 
Question 4: As per the question in section 2.3 of Children’s Services Omnibus Survey 2017, does your local authority have a function or team that is able to a) analyse the demand for children’s social care, b) identify unmet needs for individual children and families? If yes to any of the above, please specify the current number of children who have been identified as having unmet need and of those children the proportion that are disabled.

 

Question 5: In the table below, please provide an approximate indication of unmet needs for disabled children by primary support need. 
	 
	Proportion of disabled children with an unmet need by primary support reason

	Behaviour
	 

	Communication
	 

	Consciousness
	 

	Autism/Asperger's
	 

	Hand function
	 

	Hearing
	 

	Incontinence
	 

	Learning
	 

	Mobility
	 

	Personal care
	 

	Vision
	 

	Other (DDA)
	 

	Total
	 


With respect to questions 2-5, the Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

