Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. 
You asked:

I am writing to request the following information, relating to accepted planning applications in the area covered by Leicester City Council, where developments are to be/have been carried out during 2015-2020. 

How many planning applications have been accepted for improvements to:
1. Transport links e.g. new rail links, new road links

For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.

Permissions accepted since 2015 (to the present date only) are viewable by following this link: http://rcweb.leicester.gov.uk/planning/onlinequery/mainsearch.aspx
2. New commercial units (e.g. bars, clubs, cinemas, live venues)
As above.

3. Communication developments (e.g. fibre optic lines, wifi access)
As above where planning permission is required.

4. Erection of large scale dwelling estates 
As above.

Can each of the above factors be broken down by:
1. Type of development 
As above.

2. Date of requested development start
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Location of development within the area covered by Leicester City Council
Again, Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.

4. Agent/sponsor - who has submitted the planning
As above.

5. Related cost of development 


The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

