Freedom of Information Act 2000 – sick leave taken by teachers and social care workers 
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act can I ask for the following information on teaching staff and social care workers taking sick leave due to mental health-related illnesses (such as stress, depression, anxiety, bipolar disorder, etc.)

By teaching staff I am referring to teaching staff at local authority-run primary and secondary schools in your area. I would like the information for all teachers and teaching assistance staff. This includes: teaching assistants, NQTs, teachers, middle management, senior management and head teachers. 

By social care staff I am referring to staff employed by your council working in adult social care.

Please could I have information on:

1. 
a) The total number of teaching staff employed at local-authority run schools in your area in the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17?
b) The number of calendar days teaching staff have taken off due to mental health-related illnesses in the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17?
c) The number of teaching staff who have taken a period of leave due to mental health-related illnesses of one month or more in the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17
Answer:

This information is not held by the Council.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
This is because not all schools buy into the Council’s HR and payroll function as they are not obliged to.  Also, schools that do buy in don’t inform the Council of the reason for absence.

These reasons are held locally in the individual schools system.  Please contact individual schools directly via the link to the Schools’ Directory: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/schools-and-learning/school-and-colleges/find-a-school
2.   a) The number of social care staff employed by your council in the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17

2013/2014 figures were not migrated from our old HR system which is now not available.  This is a refusal notice in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act as this information is not held by the Council.
2014/15

1077

2015/16

939

2016/17

858
b) The total number of calendar days that social care staff have taken off due to mental health-related illnesses in the financial years 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16 and 2016/17 
2014/15

3485.5

2015/16

4228.5

2016/17

4905


c) The number of social care staff who have taken a period of leave due to mental health-related illnesses of one month or more 
2014/15

75

2015/16

92

2016/17

83

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

