Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

First Name, Surname, Job Title, Company Email Address, Direct Phone Number (Work), Work Mailing Address for:

1)                  Director of Children’s Services
	Caroline Tote
	Caroline.Tote@leicester.gov.uk
	0116 4544849


2)                  Assistant Director of Children’s Services
We do not have an Assistant Director Post; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3)                  Director of Adults’ Services
Director Adult Social Care & Safeguarding

	Ruth Lake
	Ruth.Lake@leicester.gov.uk
	0116 4545551


Director Adult Social Care & Commissioning

	Tracie Rees
	Tracie.Rees@leicester.gov.uk
	0116 4542301


4)                  Assistant Director of Adults’ Services
We do not have an Assistant Director Post; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5)                  Director of People Services (if applicable)
We do not have a Director of People Services Post; therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6)                  The person in charge of procurement contracts/funding for children’s and adults’ social care services.
Children’s Services:



Head of Transformation Commissioning & Intervention
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	Sue Welford
	Sue.Welford@leicester.gov.uk
	0116 4541138




Adults’ Services:
Head of Commissioning

	Kate Galoppi
	Kate.Galoppi@leicester.gov.uk
	0116 4542373


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
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