Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds not hold the information requested.

You asked:

1.    How many households are currently on your Council’s waiting list for social housing? 
As at 01/12/2017 there were 6348 households on the Housing Register.
2.    How many households have been on a waiting list for social housing for a) over 5 years or b) over 10 years c) over 15 years?
	Waiting Times
	Total

	Over 5 years
	1016

	Over 10 years
	193

	Over 15 years
	48


3.    What was the average waiting time for social housing for your Council in each of the five last financial years? (2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15. 2015/16, 2016/17)
	Financial Year
	Average Waiting Time for Social Housing

	2016-2017
	11 months

	2015-2016
	9 months

	2014-2015
	13 months

	2013-2014
	11 months

	2012-2013
	This information is not recorded


Information for 2012/13 is not held, therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4.    How many under-24s (individuals or families where the oldest individual is 24 or under) were awarded social housing in each of the five last financial years? (2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15. 2015/16, 2016/17)
Number of New Tenancies where the oldest person is aged 24 or under

	2012 -13


	2013-14
	2014-15
	2015-16
	2016-17

	241


	175
	259
	179
	154


Leicester City Council recently changed IT system and housing data was migrated from the OpenHousing system to Northgate in January 2016.  We have amalgamated the data from the two systems to provide the figures above. This was a complicated manual process and while the information provided represents information that is held in council systems the migration process may have affected its accuracy.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

