Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Autism Act 2009
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Please can I have a copy of the Leicester, Leicestershire and Rutland (LLR) Autism strategy and recent updates for meeting the needs of adults in England with autistic spectrum conditions by improving the provision of relevant services to such adults by your authority.

Answer: Please see attached
2. How many staff employed by the Leicester Local Authority or its subsidiaries have attended training under the Authorities responsibilities under the Act.

529
3. How many staff of all grades who meet or serve the public including Housing and NHO team have undertaken specific training required under the Autism Act 2009.

474
4. How much has been spent on developing the strategy under the requirements on the authority by the Autism Act 2009.

Approximately £10,000 – this does not take into account of overheads – cost of staff, etc.

5. How many people covered by the Autism Act 2009 and living in the area covered by the Leicester City Council receive Council Tax relief? (For Council Tax purposes, a person is severely mentally impaired if they have a severe and permanent impairment of intelligence and social functioning.) Broken down by type if that distinction is made, i.e. Asperger’s syndrome.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. In areas where the authority has not fulfilled their obligations under the act, when will they do so?
We have just begun a refresh of the current strategy and part of this work will be to look at how the authority is meeting its obligations under the Act. The refresh will be taking place over 2018/19 in time for a new Strategy to be in place in April 2019.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

