Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

a.) the number of drivers currently holding a taxi/PH licence
There are currently 2,103 holders of joint hackney carriage and private hire vehicle drivers licences issued by this Authority.

b.) the number of drivers who hold a licence who hold a criminal conviction. Please detail the offence, and the date of the offence. Please detail whether the licence was awarded at original application, or on appeal.
The Licensing Team are not able to retain details of convictions and copy DBS (Disclosure and Barring Service enhanced certificates) due to Data Protection requirements, therefore, this information is not held. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
c.) please provide the number of drivers who were refused licences due to criminal convictions in 2017. please detail the type of offence, and whether this was a new application or a renewal.

(The drivers do not need to be named or identified in any of these cases.) 


January 2017 – 
1 renewal: refused – refused to convey guide dog.

February 2017 –      1x continued entitlement: revoked – acting as a hackney                       

           carriage without a licence or insurance
1x renewal: refused – acting as a hackney carriage without a  licence or insurance; 

1x continued entitlement: revoked – careless driving.

March 2017 –
 nil.

April 2017 –  

1x new application: refused – drugs and other convictions. 

May 2017 – 

nil.

June 2017 – 

nil.

July 2017 – 

nil.

August 2017 -  
1x continued entitlement: revoked – alleged sexual assault.

September 2017 - 
1x continued entitlement: revoked – refused to convey guide dog.

October 2017 – 
nil.

November 2017 –
nil.

December 2017 – 
nil.                      
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

