Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

I am writing with a request for information about your local authority’s approach towards Community Asset Transfer (CAT), full details are below.  

Community Asset Transfer (CAT). CAT is the transfer of management and/or ownership of public land and buildings from its owner (usually a local authority) to a community organisation for less than market value to achieve a local social, economic or environmental benefit. In 2015/16 Locality delivered the Community Ownership and Management of Assets (COMA) programme on behalf of the Ministry of Housing, Communities and Local Government. This supported 52 partnerships between local public bodies and community groups (including parish councils) to develop multiple asset transfer or single, more complex and ground-breaking, asset projects.

1. Does the authority have a published Community Asset Transfer* policy? *Community Asset Transfer enables local authorities to transfer the ownership/management of their assets to community organisations at less than full market value – in order to achieve a defined public benefit.

Yes.

2. If Yes, please provide a web link to the policy. 
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/179364/community-assets-transfer-policy.pdf
3.
If No, is Community Asset Transfer (CAT) integrated into another policy 
within your local authority – such as wider asset management 
strategies or VCSE policies?  


Not applicable.

4.
If Yes, Please provide a web link to this policy, if published. 

Not applicable.

5.
How many of the authority’s land and property assets have been 
disposed of in the following periods: 2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15, 
2015/16, 2016/17 and 2017/18 (to date)? For the purposes of this FOI 
“disposal” means a sale on the open market for monetary 
consideration or the letting of any council land or building, or part of a 
building, regardless of the length of term of the letting. Please note we 
are not concerned with any land or property transfers to other 
departments or changing the use of the land from one statutory 
purpose to another, so please exclude these figures from your return.

6.
In relation to the number of disposals in Q5, how many were made to ‘
for-profit’* organisations in the same time periods? *For-profit 
organisations make private profit for their directors, members or 
shareholders. Different types of organisation can be ‘for-profit’. It is not 
a legal structure in and of itself.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse 
requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would 
exceed 
the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This 
represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than18 hours 
in 
determining whether the department holds the information, locating, 
retrieving and extracting the information.


This information is not recorded in a reportable format; the data relating to all 
property transactions is recorded on monthly spreadsheets of which there 
are 72 for the time frame requested. It will be necessary to check each 
transaction to establish, a, if it falls under the scope of your request, b, if the 
transaction relates to a community group and, c, if the instruction to our 
Legal Department actually resulted in a successful transaction.  We estimate  
that checking each month will require 20 – 30 minutes and in total the 
request will require 36 hours of officer time.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of 
Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the 
Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current 
form will exceed the appropriate limit.

7.
Typically, authorities operate a 5 year programme for the disposal of 
their surplus assets. Looking ahead over this period, how many of the
authority’s current land and property assets are being considered for 
declaring as surplus to requirements? *We define surplus to 
requirements as 'not required for operational purposes any more and 
as a result identified for disposal’
The authority does not operate a 5 year programme in this manner.
8.
In relation to the potential land and property assets being considered 
for declaring as surplus to requirements in Q5, what percentage of the 
authority’s existing asset base do they represent? If it is not possible to 
produce an exact percentage figure at this time, then please provide an 
estimate, and indicate if that is the case.


The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a 
refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information. Act 2000 
because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this Information is 
not held by Leicester City Council
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

