Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) – potholes
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
· How many reports and complaints about potholes have you received in each year since 2009/10?
Answer: Number of pothole repair requests from public:
2009 / 10 - 1,565
2010 / 11 - 1,614
2011 / 12 - 1,007
2012 / 13 - 1,625
2013 / 14 - 1,301
2014 / 15 - 791
2015 / 16 - 879
2016 / 17 - 873
2017 / 18 - 973 (data to 22/03/2018)
· How much was spent on resurfacing and fixing potholed roads in each year since 2009/10?
	 
	Revenue
	Capital
	Total

	2016/17
	      1,952,712 
	      1,661,215 
	      3,613,927 

	2015/16
	      1,820,012 
	      1,639,739 
	      3,459,751 

	2014/15
	      1,612,910 
	      1,861,996 
	      3,474,906 

	2013/14
	      1,948,308 
	      2,258,133 
	      4,206,441 

	2012/13
	      1,630,804 
	      1,633,745 
	      3,264,549 

	2011/12
	         692,626 
	      2,424,687 
	      3,117,313 

	2010/11
	         730,757 
	      1,265,290 
	      1,996,047 

	2009/10
	         829,542 
	      1,573,990 
	      2,403,532 


(Revenue allocations is for repairs and resurfacing

Capital maintenance allocation is for roads and footways)
· How many carriageway safety inspections have been carried out in each since year 2009-10?
We do not hold this information.  Therefore this is a refusal notice under section 1.1 of the FOIA and regulation 12 (4) (a) of EIR – information not held by Leicester City Council.

We can, however advise that an average of 8,634 safety inspections are carried out each year but some of these will be purely inspections of a footpath without a carriageway.

· How many claims relating to vehicle damage and injury, caused by potholes or uneven surfaces, have been received in each year since 2009/10?
2009 / 10 - 124

2010 / 11 - 141

2011 / 12 - 73

2012 / 13 - 114

2013 / 14 - 54

2014 / 15 - 38

2015 / 16 - 35

2016 / 17 - 38

2017 / 18 – 43 (data to 26/03/2018)
· What was the overall compensation provided by the council for successful claims relating to vehicle damage and injury as a result of potholes or uneven surfaces in each year since 2009/10?
2009 / 10 - £72,585.57

2010 / 11 - £128,434.38

2011 / 12 - £74,357.12

2012 / 13 - £80,073.27

2013 / 14 - £20,315.54

2014 / 15 - £6,524.10

2015 / 16 - £15,494.30

2016 / 17 - £6,844.09

2017 / 18 - £457.00 (data to 26/03/2018)

· Approximately what proportion of the roads in your area needed maintenance work because of uneven surfaces or potholes in each year since 2009/10?

	
	Unclassified Roads
	A Road
	 
	B Road
	 
	C Road
	 

	
	Wearing Course and Edge Deterioration
	In Needing Maintenance Soon
	In Needing Investigate Soon
	In Needing Maintenance Soon
	In Needing Investigate Soon
	In Needing Maintenance Soon
	In Needing Investigate Soon

	
	%
	RED %
	AMBER %
	RED %
	AMBER %
	RED %
	AMBER %

	2009/10
	19
	No Data*
	No Data*
	No Data*
	No Data*
	No Data*
	No Data*

	2010/11
	21
	6.7
	26.6
	9.1
	35.5
	8
	31.9

	2011/12
	22
	8.5
	38
	12.4
	45.7
	8.8
	39.3

	2012/13
	18
	8.6
	38.1
	12.4
	45.7
	8.9
	39.7

	2013/14
	17
	4.7
	26.1
	3.3
	26
	3.4
	22.5

	2014/15
	17
	5.7
	33.2
	6.7
	32.6
	3.4
	30.2

	2015/16
	10
	4.9
	29.4
	5.6
	33.4
	3.3
	26.1

	2016/17
	10
	3.9
	25.2
	6.8
	35.4
	3.3
	25.4

	2017/18
	10
	3.9
	22.1
	7
	36.1
	3.5
	27.3


* The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this is a refusal notice under section 1.1 of the FOIA and regulation 12 (4) (a) of EIR – information not held by the Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

