Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Social care case management systems
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1) What is the name of the system the council operates for both the adults and children’s social care case management systems? 
Answer: Liquid Logic IAS/Protocol
2) When do the contracts for both the adults and children’s social care case management systems expire? 
 This information is on the contracts log but for reference is it 31/03/2024
3) If the council was in a position to procure a new adult’s (and/or) children’s social care case management systems, who would be the person to lead that procurement process?  
 Carl Skidmore- City Information officer, Finance
4)  If the council was in a position to implement a new system for adult’s (and/or) children’s social care case management systems, who would be the person to lead that implementation process? 
 The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

This would be determined at the time the decision was made to procure a new solution.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

