Freedom of Information Act 2000 – housing inspections
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
How many housing inspections do you carry out per year? 

By housing inspections, we mean any inspections of council, housing association and private sector housing where you either visit the house for the purposes of inspecting the house for its state, suitability for accommodation, for regulatory or statutory purposes, for compliance to regulations (health and safety) etc.  These are inspections of the housing asset itself, you should not include visits where the purpose is to meet the residents or landlords only.  You should include:

a)
Where inspections are carried out by council staff

b)
Where you commission inspections by 3rd party organisations (either suppliers to do inspections or as a requirement of a housing authority etc.)

You clarified:

The last full year will be fine (17/18) financial year or 2017 calendar year.

This is just a general query around rough scale of activity so as long as I know what the 12 month period represents that’s fine.

a)
Where inspections are carried out by council staff
Answer: Following are number of inspections carried out for Council housing:
196 Homecome Property Inspections;
254 Mutual Exchange Property Inspections, 72 of which included EPCs (Energy Performance Certificate);
17 Full Property Inspections for Disrepair Claims;

949 Void Inspections;
332 Void EPC Inspections.
We do not hold Housing Association visits, therefore this is a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Following are the number of inspections recorded as carried out of Private Rented housing relating to health & safety hazards:

136 inspections in the calendar year 2017

Note: The recording of these activities was subject of classification changes and the extractable data understates the level of inspections and re-inspections that were undertaken in responding to complaints.  
In 2017, 769 complaints/responses were received.   
In response to previous FOIA requests we have provided the following estimates of inspections:  
2015/16 – 764; 2016/17 – 655.
b)
Where you commission inspections by 3rd party organisations (either suppliers to do inspections or as a requirement of a housing authority etc.)

None
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

