Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Leicester clothing industry
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.
You asked:
1. Any correspondence between Leicester city council staff wherein the Leicester clothing industry has been discussed over the past 12 months. This may include paper documents but also electronic correspondence such as emails. I would also like to request the minutes of the meeting mentioned above.

If this would likely exceed the cost limit under section 12 of the FOI Act 2000 or would be exempt for any other reason, then I would like to request this correspondence over the past 6 months; if this would also exceed the limit then within the past 1 month.

Such correspondence may include internal correspondence between council staff internally or correspondence between council staff and external organisations such as ACAS, Gang masters and Labour Abuse Authority and the police. 

2. Failing the acquisition of the above information for any reason, I would like to kindly ask for the minutes of this meeting and any correspondence which has specifically discussed this meeting within the past 12 months. As above, if this would likely exceed the cost limit, then within the past 6 months; if this would also exceed the limit then within 1 month. 

3. Failing all the above for any reason, I would like to kindly request the minutes from the aforementioned meeting.  

Answer: Please find attached notes from the meeting together with the meeting agenda.

No formal minutes of the event of 6th October 2017 were produced therefore the Council does not hold this information. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance & Risk Team

Leicester City Council

Legal Services

4th Floor, City Hall 
115 Charles Street

Leicester LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

