FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. How much does the council spend per year on the removal and destruction of confidential and waste paper?

	
	Full Year 2023-24
	Year to date 2024-25

	Shred Station
	2,258.90
	2,152.20

	Restore Datashred
	148.00
	0

	 
	2,406.90
	2,152.20


2. How many pages per year are collected by a third party waste company (if known) 
This information is not recorded. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. What brand of copier paper is used by the council.
Paper is branded as 'Image', 100% recycled, is 80g/m2, bright white in colour
4. How many reams of paper were bought by the council in the calendar year 2024.

5. How much did the council spend on office copier paper in the calendar year 2024. 
In response to the questions 4 and 5.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated.  Paper and card is ordered using the same account code, we cannot separate the two costs. Staff would have to trawl through every invoice to extract the number of reams ordered and collate the total cost.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

6. If there was a product available that could allow the council to dispose of all it's confidential and non-confidential waste paper onsite and turn it into recycled paper that could then be reprinted through it's copier fleet thus lowering the councils carbon footprint, would the council be interested in investing in such a product?

Possibly, although more information would be required.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
