FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Non-commercial use. To aid understanding of best approach to disrepair for social landlords, with a view to reducing the burden on rent accounts and deterring use of no-win no-fee solicitors. This relates only to claims under the pre-action protocol. 

If you do not have a housing stock, please ignore this FOI.
1. How many homes do you own? 
19,500

2. How many live housing disrepair cases are you managing? Please state if this figure does or does not include ‘dormant’ cases – i.e. those with no communication from claimant’s solicitor in 12 months or more. 
383, this does not include dormant cases.

3. Is your approach generally to defend claims, or attempt early settlement?
Defend, but dependent on details of case.

4. For the financial years 
2018-19,  - 56 claims

2019-20,  - 96 claims
2020-21,  - 69 claims
2021-22,  - 131 claims
2022-23,  - 409 claims



2023-24,  - 134 claims
can you please provide the following: 
· Disrepair claims received
Please see above.
· Disrepair claims settled in the claimants favour (within that year, even if originally receive in a different year)
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated. Staff would be required to trawl through each individual housing disrepair casefile, and all invoices etc. to provide the information requested.  

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

· Average cost of each claim settled in the claimants favour 
Please see the above response.  
· Disrepair claims settled in the defendant’s favour (within that year, even if originally receive in a different year)
Again Section 12 of the Act is applicable, please see the above response.
· Average cost of each claim settled in the defendant’s favour 
Again Section 12 of the Act is applicable, please see the above response.

· Total annual spend on defendent costs (legal and expert) 
2023-24 figure is £316,641.72 (part year). 2024-25 figure is £511,387.00 to date.

· Total Annual Spend on claimant costs (legal and expert) and Compensation 
Again, Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated. Staff would be required to trawl through each individual housing disrepair casefile, and all invoices etc. to provide the information requested.  

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

If it is not possible to provide all of the information easily, could you please focus on questions 1-3 and for the 4th, perhaps focus on just 2023-24?

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
