FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT REQUEST

1.            In the 2022 calendar year could you please state how many complaints about noise issues were recorded by your environmental health/noise complaints department?
2665

2.            In relation to the complaints in 2022 calendar year how many of these related to complaints about:

(i)            Barking dogs,



369

(ii)           Chickens and cockerels, and
18

(iii)          Sexual noise.



We do not record this information as a specific category of noise nuisance within on our reporting system.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. 
If you had any complaints that related to (iii) sexual noise please state (a) a summary of the nature of the complaint and (b) what you as the local authority did as a result of the complaint.

We do not record this information as a specific category of noise nuisance on our reporting system.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
