Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Recycling and waste data
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
As a freedom of information request, please provide the following information, for each financial year from 2018-19 up to the first two quarters of 2025/2026 (up and including September 2025). If data is not available up until this date please provide the most recent available data and specify the period it applies for: 

a - tonnage of household waste recycled under your waste disposal responsibilities 
Answer:

It is assumed that 'recycling' within this enquiry refers to the type of dry mixed recycling (DMR) which we collect from householders consisting of paper/card, plastics, glass and metal containers. It is assumed it is not referring to other waste streams that can also be recycled such as garden waste, textiles, waste electricals, wood etc. 

Leicester City Council’s waste collection rounds serve mainly householders, but a small amount of waste is also collected from some places of worship, schools, hostels and care homes. The tonnages of DMR from households will include that tonnage. As well as collecting DMR at the kerbside, residents can also deposit the same type of recycling (ie DMR) at the recycling centres and that tonnage is included.


The tonnage of DMR collected in each of the financial years since 2018 is given in the attached csv file. 


b- tonnage of collected household recycling rejected, split by how it was then processed (such as energy-from-waste / incineration, landfill)

It is not specified in the question what is meant by recycling being ‘rejected’. Waste presented by householders for recycling but which is unsuitable is rejected at various stages: 

i. Waste that is put out at the kerbside for recycling but is clearly not recycling or significantly contaminated will not be collected as recycling and will instead be collected as general waste at a later stage. We do not hold data for the tonnage rejected by collection staff at the kerbside.

ii. Collection vehicles tip at the local depot and any loads found to be significantly contaminated will be moved and processed as general waste. We do not hold data for the tonnage rejected as this stage.

iii. At the recycling centres, site operatives supervise residents depositing waste and visible contamination will be removed from the containers an placed in the correct container. We do not hold data for the tonnage rejected as this stage.

iv. The recycling (ie DMR) is bulked up at the depot and taken to a material recovery facility (MRF). Any loads that by visual inspection at the MRF is found to contain an unacceptable amount of contamination would be reloaded and rejected rather than processed through the MRF. No loads have been rejected at this stage in the relevant time period. 

v. The MRF process separates out different material types suitable for recycling and the remainder that is not segregated for recycling is sent for EfW as Refuse Derived Fuel. As the DMR from us is processed along with other waste, it is not possible to measure the amount of waste from the DMR that is rejected through the process. Instead the amount of contamination in the DMR delivered to the MRF from our authority is estimated based on results from input composition analysis carried out at the MRF. 

The estimated tonnage of contamination in the household DMR collected from the kerbside in each of the financial years since 2018 is given in the attached csv file. All of this tonnage was sent for EfW.

c- tonnage of household material recycled within England
The primary processing of the recycling referred to above is undertaken only in the UK as the DMR is sent to a UK based MRF for segregation. Through the MRF processing, various material streams are separated and sold to offtakers for further recycling. It is assumed that the question relates to the secondary processing of the materials after MRF separation.  

The attached csv file provides the tonnages of materials sent for secondary processing in the UK following MRF separation.

d- tonnage of household material recycled outside of England, split by material type if possible
See response to c above. The attached csv file provides the tonnages of materials sent for secondary processing outside the UK following MRF separation. 


e - tonnage of household recycling waste exported overseas split by how it will be processed (such as recycled or incinerated) 

Materials exported for recycling will be subject to a recycling process, not incineration.

f - if available, please provide the tonnage of household recycling waste exported overseas split by how it will be processed and destination country.

Not available.  The Council is informing you as required by Section 1(1) of the FOI Act and Regulation 12(4)(a) of the EIR, information not held.

If figures are not available in tonnage, please instead provide them in another available weight measure. If another weight measure is not available, please provide it in whatever measure is available. If possible, please provide this data as a csv file.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
