FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Polythene Sacks
1.      What type of polythene sacks do you currently use for your Environmental/Waste services/Street services such as Commercial Waste/sweeping/clinical/recycling
There are multiple types of bags used across the council. 

Grey – Street litter

Lime Green – Office waste from small businesses

Yellow - Clinical

Orange - Recycling

2.      Please supply full specifications for all sacks (sizes/colours/thickness)
Please see the attached for Grey and Lime bags

Clinical: Yellow bags, 16 x 24 inch

Recycling: Orange Tint Sack, 400 x 610 x 900 x 18micron (23Mic EQV)

3.      Which departments use each type of sack
(Grey and Lime) Parks and Open Spaces – Cleansing Services

Clinical: Waste Services

Recycling: the council’s waste collection contractor, Biffa Leicester Limited (BLL)

4.      Where are the sacks stored (depot etc)
(Grey and Lime) City Highways Stores at 90 Leycroft Rd, Leicester, LE4 1BZ - up to 8 pallets

Clinical: Gypsum Close household recycling centre - None
Recycling: the council’s waste collector, BLL waste collection depot – Up to 20 pallets
5.      How many pallets can be stored on site
See response above.
6.      How often do you purchase each type of sack and in what quantities per annum
Grey and Lime – as per the specification attached.

Clinical: As and when required

Recycling: Dependant on demand.  
7.      Please provide current supplier details for all sacks
Grey and Lime - JPK Trade Supplies Ltd and Imperial Polythene

Clinical: ESPO

Recycling: Various suppliers including Imperial  
8.      Please provide all associated current prices per 1000 sacks or alternative quantities if purchased in lesser quantities.
Individual items and costs are exempt from release as this constitutes commercial pricing from a Council-contracted provider. It is judged to be exempt under the provisions of Section 43(2) - Commercial Interests. This letter therefore is a statutory refusal notice required by Section 17(1) of the FOIA Act.  

Disclosure of this information would, or would be likely to, prejudice the commercial interests of any person (including the Public Authority holding it).

This is a qualified exemption under the FOI Act which means that consideration must also be given to whether in all the circumstances of the case the public interest favouring disclosure is greater than the public interest in maintaining the exemption. The public interest means what is in the best interests of the public not what is of interest to the public. 

We have considered whether the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosing the information. 

There are a number of public interest arguments that weigh in favour of disclosing the information you have sought: 

• The general proposition of maximising openness that the FOIA and the Council aspire to; 

• The benefits of ensuring transparent and accountable government by disclosing how the Council receives and spends public money;

However, there are also public interest arguments against disclosure: 

• Releasing the requested information could prejudice the Council’s current or future negotiation capabilities.

· Releasing the requested information would reveal the providers distinct pricing structure to the wider world, thus allowing others to undercut them or clone their approach, while providing an inferior service.

In this instance, it is judged that the public interest in withholding the requested information outweighs the public interest in disclosure of the requested information. 

9.      Are sacks purchased as part of a tender or spot/quote purchasing

Grey and Lime – targeted quotations purchasing at the moment

Clinical: As part of ESPO supplies

Recycling: Both tender systems used.

10.   Please provide contact details of the person(s) in charge of the 
purchasing of polythene sacks
Junior staff names are exempt from release under Section 40(2) of The Act as they are personal data. The Council judges that this personal data is being processed for the purposes of employment and that disclosure to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1– fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified and not incompatible purposes. Therefore, this Information is exempt from release.

11.   Do you have an annual budget for sacks? if so, what is the overall value
There is no specific budget.
12.   If purchased via tender process when is the next process planned for

Containers (Plastic or Steel, including caddy’s)
Grey and Lime - not applicable.
Clinical: Recycling: Purchased as and when through ESPO contract

13.   What type of Containers do you currently use for your 
Environmental/Waste services
· Household waste refuse and recycling bins: 1100, 660, 360, 240, 140 litre plastic wheeled bins

· Green waste – 240 litre plastic wheeled bins

· Bring sites – 1100 litre steel bins

14.   Please supply specifications for all containers
· Household waste refuse and recycling bins: 1100, 660, 360, 240, 140 litre plastic wheeled bins – standard spec

· Green waste – 240 litre plastic wheeled bins; EN840; hot foil stamping to lid and bin body including serial numbers

· Bring sites – 1100 litre steel bins; propeller style aperture within DMR lid; full artwork to front of bin; handles to clamp to existing locking posts.

15.   Which departments use each type of container
· Household waste refuse and recycling bins: waste services

· Green waste – waste services

· Bring sites – waste services

16.   Where are the containers stored (depot etc)
BLL waste collection depot and Gypsum Close household recycling centre.
17.   How many containers can be stored on site
BLL waste collection depot – approx. 1000 

Gypsum Close household recycling centre - the Council does not hold this information; therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

 18.   How often do you purchase each type of container and in what quantities
Ad hoc as and when required.

19.   Please provide current supplier details for all containers (table)
· Household waste refuse and recycling bins: waste services - Various suppliers are used.  We market test each time containers are purchased. Contenur supplied the last delivery

· Green waste – last order was made with ESE

· Bring sites – last order made with Storm Environmental

20.   Please provide all associated current prices per container
As above, this information is commercially sensitive and exempt from release under S43 of the Act

21.   Are containers purchased as part of a tender or spot purchasing
· Household waste refuse  and recycling bins, bring bank bins: Generally Spot but suppliers are on Biffa’s “Preferred Supplier” list 

· Green waste – Purchased as and when required using ESPO framework.

22.   Please provide contact details of the person(s) in charge of the purchasing of containers
Again, junior staff names are exempt from release under Section 40(2) of The Act as they are personal data. 

23.   Do you have an annual budget for containers? if so, what is the overall value
No.

24.   If purchased via tender process when is the next process planned for

· Green waste – Purchased as and when required using ESPO framework. Most containers purchased directly by contractor.

· Household waste refuse  and recycling bins, bring bank bins: No date set at present
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
