Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: children in temporary accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. How many children are currently in temporary accommodation as of the 1st of November 2024?

Answer:

Number of children, newborn to age 17 = 1030

2. The breakdown of these children in educational categories:
- How many are in primary education?
669

- How many are in secondary education?
103

- How many are registered as being 15 years of age?

26

3. For children currently on your homeless waiting lists:
- How many are known to have health conditions?
- How many are registered as disabled?

This information is not recorded on our system. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. Spending on temporary accommodation from 1st November 2023 to 1st November 2024:
- Total amount spent on temporary accommodation.
- Breakdown of spending on different types of accommodation (e.g., hotels or B&Bs, private landlords, council-owned properties).

Bed & Breakfast £16,491,515
Accommodation (Private Landlords) £3,042,400
	LCC Hostels £2,170,884.90
	


These are gross costs excluding VAT and do not include any HB etc. to offset payments.


5. The number of tenant complaints regarding temporary accommodation during this period (1st November 2023 - 1st November 2024).

This information is not recorded in a reportable format on our system. It will require a manual trawl to collate the information.  

In 23/24 we received 1000 or so complaints. 600 of those were housing related. We'd need to access the complaints system, isolate the 600 complaints, click into each one, read the complaint email/letter/notification from the complainant to identify whether it's about housing and then about temporary accommodation. 

Some might be very straightforward and easy to read, others might be much more complex and therefore take longer to consider. Occasionally, we also seek clarification from complainants if things aren't clear. When those complaints have been isolated, we'd have to check each one of the complainants (or the person that is the subject of the complaint if it's been put in by their representative) in the Housing system to identify whether they're housing tenants or not. On the basis that might take 5 minutes at least for each complaint review, that's about 3000 minutes, or 50 hours. 
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The Council has duly determined that to undertake such an exercise would exceed the limit specified above.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine and resubmit your request so that it reduces the cost to within the 'appropriate limit'.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
