Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered. The Council holds the information requested.

You asked:

Leicester City Council has been identified by the Ministry of Housing, Communities & Local Government ("MHCLG"), as a local authority with 1 to 5 buildings with ACM cladding systems that failed large-scale system tests undertaken since the Grenfell Tower fire, and consequently have been deemed non-compliant with Building Regulations.

We hereby request the following relevant information:

1. Identification of the "1-5 buildings" with ACM cladding systems that failed large-scale system tests.
The Summit, Eastern Boulevard, Leicester

Merlin Heights, Bath Lane, Leicester 


2. Building Control records relevant to the application for Building Regulations approval for the ACM cladding systems applied to those buildings, including the Building Control Officer's assessment/report, and information submitted by the applicant.
This information is not held by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.
The Application Type in each instance was an Initial Notice from an Approved Inspector.  Please see the attached screenshots, there are two which relate to the Bath Lane site, the second is for the remedial works regarding the cladding.  The Final Certificate issued by Align Building Control Ltd is attached.

3. Fire risk assessments for those buildings in force immediately prior to completion of the cladding works, immediately following completion of the cladding works, and since the Grenfell Tower fire on 14 June 2017.
Leicester City Council do not hold this information. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.
4. Identification of those buildings within the borough for which the assessment of compliance with Building Regulations was the local authority and those for the assessment was made by an Approved Inspector.
The Building Control function for both buildings was carried out by Approved Inspectors


5. Whether the relevant social housing buildings are managed by an arms-length management organisation or tenant management organisation, and if so, when such arrangement commenced.
Not applicable.


6. Correspondence with MHCLG in relation to the buildings with ACM cladding systems, including associated testing and remedial action.

Please find the relevant information attached.  Please note that details of third parties involved (employees) have been redacted (removed). 

The Council judges that this personal data is being processed for the purposes of employment and that disclosure to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1– fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified and not incompatible purposes.  Therefore, this Information is exempt from release.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance and Risk
Leicester City Council

Legal Services
4th Floor City Hall

115 Charles Street

Leicester  
LE1 1FZ
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

