Freedom of Information Act 2000 - homelessness
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. How many people are homeless currently?

Answer:

As at 20th January - there were 452 homeless applications ongoing with ‘Relief Duty’, or ‘Main Duty’ active.
In terms of “people” (i.e. individuals that are part of ongoing applications rather than the number of applications) this equates to 673
2. How many people are at risk of becoming homeless?
As at 20th January - there were 493 homeless applications ongoing with ‘Prevention Duty’ active.
In terms of “people” (i.e. individuals that are part of ongoing applications rather than the number of applications) this equates to 1189.

3. How many people are in financial difficulties with their rent or bills?
The Council does not record this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

However, the council has 53,942 council tax accounts that have had recovery action commenced from reminders onwards.  This covers council tax debts for all years.  It should be noted that some council tax payers will have more than one account. 
 

Similarly, 3,864 business rates account accounts have had recovery action commenced from reminders onwards.  This covers business rates debts for all years and again some rate payers will have more than one account.
4. What computer systems, methods, surveys do you use to understand the communities’ issues with finances, or if people are classed as vulnerable adults or homelessness? 
OpenRevenue

LiqudLogic

5. Are each offices or third parties linked to the same system, enabling effective statistics?
Revenues and Benefits administration has access to Northgate to view accounts etc.

All benefit recipients have their rent accounts linked to their benefit claim.
6. What is the contact for the homeless shelter/helpers? Social Services? Or other third party agencies?
Contacts for services, including homelessness accommodation & support, and Social Services, are publicly available on Leicester City Council’s website https://www.leicester.gov.uk/
This letter therefore constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain i.e. the Council’s website.

7. Do you share the above with the government weekly, monthly or yearly? Who do you share the statistics of the above information, do you have a contact to supply?
With regard to the homelessness data referred to in Q1 and Q2, we share this information and more as part of our Statutory Return to the Ministry of Housing, Communities, and Local Government, on a quarterly basis.  
Data can be found at https://www.gov.uk/government/statistical-data-sets/live-tables-on-homelessness 
We are not aware of any public-facing email contact for the Ministry of Housing, Communities, and Local Government’s Statistics team so are unable to provide this.
This is therefore a refusal in accordance with exemption Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
8. Any other email contacts related to the above content?
As above, this information is not held by the Council and this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act.  
9. What support systems are in place currently for the above people?

This question is very broad so we will provide a high-level summary of the main services.  This will not be exhaustive.

There are a number of support systems in place for those facing homelessness in the form of advice, negotiation, mediation, assistance, temporary accommodation, along with support to access long term accommodation for those customers requiring long term accommodation through the Housing Register and the Private Rented Sector.  Customers are supported to access private sector accommodation in an affordable way via the Council’s landlord incentive schemes, which secure properties for use by people with the most critical housing needs.

Customers who are facing homelessness within 56 days, or homeless currently, can apply for assistance under Part 7 of the Housing Act 1996, at which point, following an assessment of need, applicants will be provided with advice and assistance in the form of a Personalised Housing Plan.  Support therefore will be dependent on the individual circumstances of the case, in line with legislation and guidance.

Those who are rough sleeping and/or have a history of repeat homelessness can get enhanced support from Outreach Services and Revolving Door / Transitions services is also provided to those sleeping rough and with a history of homelessness.

Vulnerable tenants who need help in sustaining their accommodation, and avoiding homelessness, can get support from the Council’s STAR team and/or referrals into the Council’s commissioned 3rd sector ‘floating support’ provider, offering advice and practical support and coaching to sustain and manage their accommodation through targeted one to one support.

With regard to those in financial difficulties, in addition to some of the above, as appropriate, there is support through Discretionary Housing Benefit fund, debt advice, and assistance which can include referrals and/or signposting to Community Grants, and 3rd sector organisations.  There are additional grants to support new tenants with white goods/household items via the Community Support Grant and added support is also provided via the new Covid 19 Hardship Fund. 

In addition to the above, the Council always takes opportunities offered by central government to try new and innovative schemes, and we are currently taking part in the government’s Everyone In Initiative, Next Step Accommodating Programme, Rough Sleeper Accommodation Programme, Protect Programme, Cold Weather Programme, Rough Sleeping initiative, and more, all of which aim to improve and expand the services that we can provide to those most at risk.

Finally, Leicester City Council works with various charities, faith groups, and 3rd sector organisations through partnership working. To ensure that the city has a holistic and ‘together’ offer for citizens at risk of or effected by homelessness.  Leicester City Council is part of Leicester’s Homelessness Charter.

10. How many empty unused buildings are there within your location/ land? 
As at 31st December 2020 the total number of residential empty properties citywide is 5626 which includes all tenure; misinformation, non-priority housing and 2nd homes that fall outside of our remit. 
The remaining, privately owned residential family accommodation, empty over 18 months are added to our caseload. As at 31.12.20 and our current active caseload is 344.
We have been successful in returning 124 properties back to occupation so far in 2020-21.

11. How do you record these statistics?

They are recorded in The Housing Division’s Performance Report.

12. Do you liaise with government and supply the statistics also, can you supply the email contact
No.
13. What is the complaints email and contact for people in financial difficulty, homeless or vulnerable?
Customers wanting to raise complaints can email the complaints department on complaints@leicester.gov.uk 

14. Is there a Human Rights officer in place currently that interlinked all agencies, social services, council and government?

There is no role within the authority that holds such a post. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
