

## **FOIA 3722 B Gunn**

<p>1. Wi-Fi Provider- Who is the contracted supplier for the Wi-Fi contract.</p>	<p>The Cloud</p>	<p>Lorensberg (Netloan)</p>
<p>2. Average Annual Spend – Please state the annual average spend over three years for each supplier. If this is a new contract please state the estimate annual average spends. If there is more than one Wi-Fi provider please split annual for each individual provider.</p>	<p>£2400 Annually</p>	<p>£7321.34 Annually</p>
<p>3. Number of Users- Please state the number of users the Wi-Fi contract is in place for. An estimate number of users will also be acceptable. If there is more than one Wi-Fi provider please state the number of users for each individual provider.</p>	<p>Public use only, Numbers vary, exact information not held.  6 Wireless Access Points on one site</p>	<p>Public use only, Numbers vary, exact information not held.  51 Wireless Access Points over 16 sites</p>
<p>4. Number of Locations/Site- I require the number of locations/sites the Wi-Fi contract is contracted for. If there is more than one Wi-Fi provider please state the number of sites for each individual provider.</p>	<p>One</p>	<p>16 Libraries</p>
<p>5. End User Offer- What the Wi-Fi offers to the end users e.g. Unlimited, Pay as you go, free 1 hour access or just free access. If there is more than one Wi-Fi provider please state the number of sites for each individual provider.</p>	<p>60 min free access.</p>	<p>Unlimited during library opening hours</p>
<p>6. Manufacturer Name/Brand- Please provides me with the brand names of the Wi-Fi equipment which many include manufacturers of the access points and routers. If there is more than one Wi-Fi provider please state the</p>	<p>Cisco</p>	<p>Cisco</p>

Manufacturers Name for each individual provider.		
7. Contract Description- Please provide me with a brief description of the solution in place for Wi-Fi and any other services provided under the contract. If there is more than one Wi-Fi provider please state the contract description for each individual provider.	To allow members of the public to interact with displays in the museum	To allow library users to bring their own devices and connect to the Internet
8. Actual Contract Start Date- Please can you state the Start date of the contract. If there is more than on Wi-Fi provider please split contract dates for each individual provider.	22 <sup>nd</sup> August 2011	1 <sup>st</sup> September 2010
9. Actual Contract Renewal/Expiry Date- Please can you state the renewal/expiry date of the contract. If the contract is coming up for renewal if possible please state the likely outcome of the Wi-Fi contract.	22 <sup>nd</sup> August 2014	31 <sup>st</sup> August 2014