
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000  
 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s 
response to your questions is shown below. 
 
You asked: 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, please provide me with the 
following Information:  
 
1) Has Mr Naresh Parmar entered into a contract for the lease of the 
property? If no, please state the reasons why?  
 
ANSWER 
 
Yes. 
 
2) Has Mr Naresh Parmar submitted a planning application? if no, please 
state the date when it is anticipated an application will be submitted.  
 
No. A planning application will hopefully be submitted within 9 months of 
entering into the conditional contract for the purchase of the Hall. 
 
3) Who will decide how the £500,000 financial support will be spent, the 
Leicester City Council or Mr Naresh Parmar? 
 
Both parties have decided how the financial support will be spent. 
 
4) Please provide a list and photographers of all vandalism that 
occurred inside the property in April 2013 
 
No such photographs of the property are held on file.  Therefore this part of 
this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this 
information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
 
 
5) Why was it printed in the "Braunstone Park User Group Meeting Notes 
10th June" & "The Braunstone Alert september 2013" that planning 
permission could / most likely will take up to 6 months to process?   
 
This is not an unreasonable timescale to obtain planning permission for such 
a property. 
 
6) Will Mr Naresh Parmar be present at the next "Braunstone Park User 
Group Meeting" in September? 
 
Such information is not known by the Council’s Property Department.  
Therefore this part of this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of 



the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 
of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 
 
 
7) On what date did the Leicester City Council last have contact with Mr 
Naresh Parmar?  
 
The Council’s Property Department last had contact with Mr Parmar on 
17/09/13. 
 
8) In the event that Mr Naresh Parmar's proposed plans for the property 
don't come to fruition, what action does the leicester city council 
propose to take to resolve the issue to bring the property back into use?  
 
In such an event all options for the property will be explored at that time.  
 
9) please provide a breakdown copy of all repair/maintenance works that 
have been undertaken to the property since 05/06/2013 
 
Property  Works Order Description  Date Raised 
 
Braunstone Hall Isolate 3 no lights and take down  

fittings as required    05/06/2013 
 
Braunstone Hall  Roofing works related to dry  

rot work     27/06/2013 
 
Braunstone Hall  Clean out manhole and replace   

missing manhole frame and lid  
to left-hand side of main entrance  
inside steel pallasade fence  22/07/2013 

 
Braunstone Hall  Replace manhole cover   23/07/2013 
 
10) please provide a list of vandalism that has occurred since 11/06/2013 
(please also include the number of incidents that have been reported to 
the police, and crime numbers) 
 
There are no records of vandalism from 11/6/13 to present day. There was an 
unexplained intruder alarm activation on 18/8/13 but no evidence of a break in 
so the incident was not reported to the Police. 
 
 
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own 
personal use. Please be aware that any commercial or other use, for example 
publication, sale, or redistribution may be a breach of copyright under the 
Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 as amended unless you obtain the 
copyright holder's prior permission.  
 



Not all the information that is supplied which is covered by copyright will be 
the Council's copyright, for example it may be the copyright of a government 
department or another Council. You should seek either the Council’s consent 
or their consent as appropriate. The Council is willing to advise you of any 
such potential issues on request.   In order to make a request to re-use the 
information please contact the Information Governance Manager using the 
details below.  
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to:  
Information Governance Manager 
Information and Customer Access 
Leicester City Council 
FREEPOST (LE985/33)  
New Walk Centre  
LEICESTER LE1 6ZG  
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 
Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address 
within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such 
request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s 
absolute discretion. 
 
You can also complain to the Information Commissioner at:  
Information Commissioner's Office  
Wycliffe House  
Water Lane  
Wilmslow SK9 5AF  
Telephone: 01625 545 700  
www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk  
 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally 
consider appeals or complaints until the internal appeals and complaints 
processes of the public authority which is answering the request have been 
exhausted.  You are therefore advised to complain or appeal to the 
Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner. 
 


