Education
1. Please state the name(s), job title(s) and contact details of the person(s) completing this section 
	Marie Allison, Service manager , Special Needs Teaching Service, Leicester City
Email: marie.allison@leicester.gov.uk



2. Do you plan on reducing the overall budget allocated for the specialist education support service for deaf/hearing impaired children in 2014/15?

No

3. Do you plan on reducing the overall number of specialist education staff working with deaf/hearing impaired children in 2014/15?

No

4. Please complete the tables below giving details of the budgeted spend for specialist education services for deaf/hearing impaired children in 2013/14 and 2014/15.
We have already included the information your authority provided last year and have given a column for you to state if budgeted spend is expected to vary from actual spend. Please use figures for budgeted spend (NOT actual spend) for 2014/15 figures.  
	
	2013/14
	Please state how much was spent on the peripatetic service
	Please state how much is spent on hearing impairment units/resource bases.
	Is your actual spend for 2013/14 likely to vary significantly from this figure? If yes, please explain why

	Net budget (£) (i.e. budget allocation)
	721,500
	720,600
	900
	No

	Gross budget(£) (i.e. budget allocation plus any additional income generated or expected to be generated)
	721,500
	720,600
	900
	No


  b)
	
	2014/15 
	Please state how much is spent on the peripatetic service 
	Please state how much is spent on hearing impairment units/resource bases. 
	If there is a planned reduction since 2013/14 please explain why

	Net budget (£) (i.e. budget allocation)
	721,500
	720,600
	900
	No

	Gross budget(£) (i.e. budget allocation plus any additional income generated or expected to be  generated)
	751,500
	720,600
	900
	No


c)  Do the figures above include any budgeted spend on children without a hearing impairment?   (eg. visually impaired children, other SEN etc)
i. No
ii. If yes, please provide details (e.g. visually impaired children, other SEN etc) 
	No



d) Please complete the table below giving details of the budgeted spend for equipment or adaptations (e.g. radio aids, acoustic treatments) for deaf/hearing impaired children in 2013/14 and 2014/15.

	2013/14 budget
	2014/15 budget
	Responsible department (who holds the budget)
	If there is a planned reduction since 2013/14 please explain why

	11,000

	11,000
	Childrens’ Services
	


e) Please complete the table below stating whether you charged for any part of your service for deaf/hearing impaired children and if you have plans to charge in 2014/15.

	Did/will you charge for:
	In 2013/14 
	Who did you charge? 
	In 2014/15
	Who will you charge?

	Support for children without statements?
	Yes
	post 16 education and general training 
	Yes
	post 16 education and  general training

	Equipment?
	No
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)
	No
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)

	Transport?
	No
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)
	No
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)

	Post 16 support?
	Yes
	post 16 education (please state) 
	Yes
	post 16 

	Training?
	Yes
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)
	Yes
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)

	Other? Please specify


	No
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)
	No
	schools/academies/health services/post 16 education and training provider/other (please state)


5. Please complete the table below detailing the number of deaf children belonging
 to and supported
 by your service in 2013/14 and 2014/15. 

	
	2013/14
	2014/15 anticipated numbers (these could be based on screening figures or prevalence data)

	Number of children belonging


	439
	439

	Number of children supported 


	299
	299


6. Please complete the table below giving details of budgeted staffing levels in the specialist education service for deaf/hearing impaired children in 2013/14 and 2014/15.  
If any of the posts include a combination of management and service delivery roles or if staff work flexibly across roles, please ensure the approximate time spent on each is accurately divided between rows a), b) and/or c) and expressed as a full time equivalent (fte)
We have already included the information your authority provided last year and have given a column for you to update if this changed during the year.

	
	2013/14 number of fte posts

	How many of these posts were vacant/ frozen in 2013/14?


	Please confirm if this information is accurate as of 01/03/2014
	2014/15 number of fte posts 
	How many of these posts will be vacant/ frozen in 2014/15?

	a) Team management (e.g. team leader, Head of Service etc)
	1.0
	0.00
	Yes
	1.0
	0.00

	b) Specialist Teachers of the Deaf involved in direct peripatetic service delivery
	9.2
	0.60
	Yes
	9.2
	0.60

	c) Specialist Teachers of the Deaf involved in specialist or resource provision*
	
	
	
	
	

	d) Communication support workers, specialist teaching assistants etc*
	2.8
	1.0 (Technician post pending the audiology review)
	Yes
	2.8
	1.0 (Technician post pending the audiology review)

	e) Other (please give details)


	1.0 Educational Audiologist  
	
	Yes
	1.0 Educational Audiologist  
	


*You may need to ask individual schools for this information
7. Please complete the table below in full.  In 2013/14, did any of the following take place or are there plans for them to take place in 2014/15?
	
	2013/14
	
	2014/15

	
	Yes
	No
	
	Yes
	No plans 
	Not known

	a) We undertook / plan to undertake an SEN review of the specialist education service for deaf/hearing impaired children 
	
	(
	
	
	(
	

	b) We undertook / plan to undertake a reorganisation of the specialist education service for deaf/hearing impaired children 
	
	(
	
	
	
	(

	c) We restricted / plan to restrict the eligibility criteria for accessing the specialist education service for deaf/hearing impaired children 
	
	(
	
	
	
	(

	d) We reduced / plan to reduce the budget available for training staff who work with deaf/hearing impaired children 
	
	(
	
	
	
	(

	e) We have changed/plan to change the way we deliver support to deaf young people in post 16 education settings including FE colleges
	(
	
	
	(
	
	


8. If you have answered yes to any of question 7 or your answers to questions 4 to 6 show reduced staffing or budget, please provide information about how families have or will be consulted.
Possibility of increasing support to FE with dedicated staff
Information attached/linked - No

9. With implementation of SEN reform planned for September 2014, we are also interested to know details of the budgeted spend for specialist education services for deaf/hearing impaired and young people aged 0-25 in 2014/15.
Please complete the table below:
	
	2014/15
	Please state how much is spent on the peripatetic service
	Please state how much is spent on hearing impairment units/resource bases.

	Net budget for specialist education services for deaf children and young people aged 

0-25 (£) (i.e. budget allocation)
	721,500
	720,600
	900

	Gross budget for specialist education services for deaf children and young people aged 

0-25 (£) (i.e. budget allocation plus any additional income generated or expected to be generated)
	721,500
	720,600
	900


Speech and Language Therapy
PLEASE NOTE - You may require information from your local health services to complete the questions in this section

10.  Please state the name(s), job title(s) and contact details of the person(s) completing this section 

	We have not completed this section as speech and language therapy is provided by the Health Service. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.



11.  Do you provide any generic speech and language therapy services that can be used by deaf/hearing impaired children?

No 
a) If yes, please complete the below table stating what funding was allocated to speech and language therapy services that can be used by deaf/hearing impaired children in 2013/14, and what funding has been allocated for 2014/15? 

If you do not hold a specific budget for deaf/hearing impaired children, please give figures for any of the overarching budgets these services are funded from, and state which service, team or departments this budget covers.

	
	2013/14
	Who manages this budget? (please tick all that apply)
	2014/15
	Who manages this budget? (please tick all that apply)
	If there has been a reduction, please explain

	Net budget allocated (£)
	
	Health [  ]

Local Authority 
[  ]

Schools [  ]

Other (please state) [  ]


	
	Health [  ]

Local Authority [  ]

Schools [  ]

Other (please state) [  ]


	


12.  Please complete the table below stating how many deaf/hearing impaired children were supported by your generic speech and language therapy service in 2013/14 and how many you plan to support in 2014/15?

	
	2013/14
	2014/15

	Number of deaf children supported
	
	


13.  Do you provide speech and language therapy services that specialise in working with deaf/hearing impaired children

No

a) If yes, please complete the below table stating what funding was allocated to specialist speech and language therapy services for deaf/hearing impaired children in 2013/14, and what funding has been allocated for 2014/15?

	
	2013/14
	Who manages this budget? (please tick all that apply)
	2014/15
	Who manages this budget? (please tick all that apply)
	If there has been a reduction, please explain

	Net budget allocated (£)
	
	Health [  ]

Local Authority [  ]

Schools [  ]

Other (please state) [  ]


	
	Health [  ]

Local Authority [  ]

Schools [  ]

Other (please state) [  ]


	


14.  Please complete the table below stating how many deaf/hearing impaired children were supported by your specialist speech and language therapy service in 2013/14 and how many you plan to support in 2014/15?

	
	2013/14
	2014/15

	Number of deaf children supported
	
	


15.  Do you provide speech and language therapy services for deaf/hearing impaired children:

a) As part of the hearing support service?
        Yes/No
b) Jointly with local health services?

        Yes/No

c) Through a school?



        Yes/No
d) Through a children’s centre or early years setting   Yes/No

e) In another way – please explain below
	


16.  Please complete the table below giving details of budgeted staffing levels for generic and/or specialist speech and language therapy services for deaf/hearing impaired children in 2013/14 and 2014/15.

Please give answers as a full time equivalent figure (fte)
	
	2013/14 number of fte posts – please state how many of these are specialists in deafness

	How many, if any, of these posts were vacant/ frozen in 2013/14?


	2014/15 number of fte posts – 
please state how many of these are specialists in deafness

	How many, if any, of these posts will be vacant/ frozen in 2014/15?

	a) Speech and Language Therapists working with deaf/hearing impaired children funded centrally by the local authority
	
	
	
	

	b) Speech and Language Therapist Assistants working with deaf/hearing impaired children funded centrally by the local authority
	
	
	
	

	c) Speech and Language Therapists working with deaf/hearing impaired children funded by health
	
	
	
	

	d) Speech and Language Assistants working with deaf/hearing impaired children funded  by health
	
	
	
	

	e) Speech and Language Therapists working with deaf/hearing impaired children funded by a school
	
	
	
	

	f) Speech and Language Therapist Assistants working with deaf/hearing impaired children funded by a school
	
	
	
	


17.  a) Please attach the eligibility criteria for deaf children to be able to access your speech and language therapy service.
b) Has this criteria changed in the last 12 months?
Yes/No

c) If yes, please explain

	


18.  Is speech and language therapy offered to families with deaf/hearing impaired children through direct payments/personal budgets?
   Yes/No
a) If yes, how many families have taken it up?

	


 With implementation of SEN reform planned for September 2014, we are also interested to know details of the budgeted spend for your generic and/or specialist speech and language therapy services for deaf/hearing impaired children and young people aged 0-25 in 2014/15.

Please complete the table below:

	
	2014/15
	Who manages this budget? (please tick all that apply)

	Net budget allocated for generic speech and language therapy services for deaf/hearing impaired children and young people aged 0-25 (£)
	
	Local Authority [  ]

Health [  ]

Schools [  ]

Other (please state) [  ]



	Net budget allocated for specialist speech and language therapy services for deaf/hearing impaired children and young people aged 0-25 (£)
	
	Local Authority [  ]

Health [  ]

Schools [  ]

Other (please state) [  ]




Social Care
19.  Please state the name(s), job title(s) and contact details of the person(s) completing this section 

	Sandra Holyoake, Service Manager, Disabled Children’s Service. Sandra.Holyoake@leicester.gov.uk


	


20.  Please complete the table below, stating what funding was allocated to social care services for disabled children in 2013/14, and what funding has been allocated for 2014/15? Examples include (but are not limited to) funding for assessments and equipment. If possible, please also state what funding was allocated to deaf/hearing impaired children specifically in 2013/14 and 2014/15.
If your local authority does not hold a specific budget for deaf/hearing impaired children, please give figures for any of the overarching budgets these services are funded from, and state which service, team or departments this budget covers e.g. children with disabilities, short breaks, deaf/hearing impaired adults and children etc.
	
	2013/14
	2014/15
	Who provides this budget? (name each service, team or department)
	If there has been a reduction, please explain why.

	Overarching net budget for all disabled children (£)

	£1.8m

	£1.3m
To be confirmed as budgets are still being built
	£1.269m Children’s Services
£13K Health

£17k Adult Social Care
	Re-organisation and 2 services merging

	Budget allocated specifically for deaf/hearing impaired children 
(£) 
(if you have one)
	Nil
	Nil
	
	


a) Do you identify a specific budget for specialist support for deaf/hearing impaired children involved in safeguarding (section 47) investigations?

      No

21.  Please complete the table below stating how many deaf/hearing impaired children were supported by your social care service in 2013/14 and how many you plan to support in 2014/15?

	
	2013/14
	2014/15

	Number of deaf children supported
	47
	Unknown at this time as there is new work being planned 


22.  Do you commission out or spot purchase any services for deaf children?
Yes
a) If yes, please give details including whether the contract is for adults, children or both.
	We spot purchase interpreters



23.  Please complete the table below giving details of budgeted staffing levels of social care services for deaf/hearing impaired children.  
Please give answers as a full time equivalent figure (fte)

	
	2013/14

number of fte posts
	Of those how many have a qualification in British Sign Language (BSL)
	2014/15 

number of fte posts
	Of those how many have a qualification in British Sign Language (BSL)

	a) Social workers for deaf/hearing impaired children 
	0
	BSL level 1  [           ]
BSL level 2  [           ]
BSL level 3  [           ]
BSL level 4  [           ]

(or above)         
	0.5
	BSL level 1  [           ]     
BSL level 2  [           ]
BSL level 3  [           ]
BSL level 4  [           ]

(or above)

                    

	b) Other support workers for deaf/hearing impaired children 
	1
	BSL level 1  [      2     ]
BSL level 2  [           ]
BSL level 3  [           ] 
BSL level 4  [           ]

(or above)

                    
	2
	BSL level 1  [  2         ]
BSL level 2  [           ]
BSL level 3  [           ]
BSL level 4  [           ]

(or above)

                    


24.  Please state which team or department provides equipment for deaf/hearing impaired children:
	The hearing and impairment team in the Special Needs Teaching Service (SNTS) complete assessments and the equipment required is provided by the health service.



a) Has there has been any change in the eligibility criteria for accessing equipment for disabled children in the last 12 months?
No

b) If yes, please give details

	From April 2014 additional funding is being provided to recruit an assistive technology development worker plus funding for the necessary equipment.  This is for all disabled children including deaf and hearing impaired.



25.  How many families of disabled children accessed direct payments/personal budgets for social care in your local authority in 2013/14 and what did they use them for?

	Currently 115. Spending is available to access social opportunities (typically spent on support workers to facilitate this) and homecare to support with moving and handling and assist children with personal care in some circumstances.




26.  Has there has been any change in the eligibility criteria for accessing direct payments/personal budgets for disabled children in the last 12 months?

No

a) If yes, please give details

	


27.  With implementation of SEN reform planned for September 2014, we are also interested to know details of the budgeted spend for disabled children and/or specialist social care services for deaf/hearing impaired children and young people aged 0-25 in 2014/15.

Please complete the table below:

	
	2014/15
	Who provides this budget? (name each service, team or department)

	Overarching net budget for all disabled children and young people aged 0-25 (£)


	We have no distinct budget for deaf/hearing impaired children
	

	Budget allocated specifically for deaf/hearing impaired children and young people aged 0-25
(£) 

(if you have one)
	Nil
	


� Belonging = all deaf children who live in the LA, regardless of the educational setting they attend and where this is located. This therefore includes deaf children who live within the LA boundary but attend schools outside of the LA. It excludes deaf children who live outside of your local authority but attend schools in your authority.


� Supported = children whose home address is located within the LA for which the LA has responsibility irrespective of where they attend school and who receive some form of support more than once a year.  Examples of support include direct teaching, visits to the family or school, liaison with the family, school, teachers, providing hearing aid checks, etc.
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