Social care mapping survey 

Please note:

All questions refer to the position as of 31st January 2014, unless otherwise stated. 

If any of your answers would benefit from some context or additional explanation, a comment box is provided at the end of each section. 

Please note if some responsibilities are now shared with an adult or transitions teams for certain age groups please ensure they also fill in any relevant information within this survey)
Section 1: General information

1.1 Local authority or authorities (LA/LAs)  covered by the service 
	Leicester


1.2 Name of your service 
	Disabled Children’s Services 


1.3 Your name
	Sandra Holyoake


1.4 Your email address
	sandra.holyoake@leicester.gov.uk


Section 2: Social care responsibilities towards deaf children
2.1. What is the name of the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people? (e.g. children with disabilities team / sensory impairment team / child in need team)
Please state:
Disabled Children’s Services
2.2. How would you best describe this team?
                                                                 

Please tick
	General children’s disability team

	X

	General children and adults disability team

	

	Child in need team / Locality Team

	

	Multi-disciplinary team (including health or education)

	

	Specialist sensory / deaf team

	

	Specialist multi-disciplinary sensory / deaf team (including health or education)
	

	Other (please state)

	


2.3. Is this team located in...?
                                            



Please tick
	Children’s services

	X

	Adult services
	

	Voluntary sector  
(via a contracted out service)  
	

	Other (please state)
	


2.4. What is the age range of children / adults which this team works with?
Age range                  
   Please tick
	0-14 years
	

	0-18 years
	

	0-25 years
	X


	Birth to death
	

	Other: please state

	


2.5. Please can you confirm which duties listed below are the sole responsibility of this team and which duties are co-worked?
	          Duties
	   Sole responsibility
	Co-worked (please state name of team with which duty is co-worked)

	Section 17 child in need assessments

	X
	

	Section 47 safeguarding

	X
	

	Sect 20 / 31 looked after

	X
	

	Transitions (DPAct 1986)

	
	Co-worked with Adult’s Transition Team 


Please note: Some authorities have formal agreements for specialist voluntary providers to assess and provide equipment/assistive devices to deaf children and young people on behalf of children’s social care. This is looked at later in the survey.
2.6. How many deaf children have accessed a social care service in the financial year 2013/2014?
	Number
	Please tick if not known

	
	X



2.7. Comment box / additional information on this section  
We do not keep separate records for this
Section 3: Staffing
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)

3.1. Do you have a dedicated social worker whose purpose is to work with deaf children?
	Yes
	No

	X
	


If you said no, please go to question 3.6
3.2. How many designated posts for deaf children are there in the team (expressed as full time equivalent (fte))? 
	1 (however we have a worker who is focusing on developing this area)



3.3. Of the above post(s), are they combined with other duties? (e.g. working with vision impaired children or other disabled children within the team?
	Yes
	No

	x
	


3.4. If yes, please give details of which other duties these posts are combined with? 

Other general social work duties
3.5. Of the staff shown in question 3.2, please indicate below the British Sign Language qualifications held 
	   BSL Level
	Number of staff

	None 


	

	Level 1
	

	Level 2
	

	Level 3 or above 
	


3.6. If you have indicated that you do not have a dedicated social worker for deaf children (question 3.1), do you have any other arrangements in place to work with deaf children?

	Yes
	No

	
	


 If yes, please describe these:
3.7. Comment box / additional information on this section 
Section 4: Eligibility criteria
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)

4.1. Does the eligibility criteria for a referral into the team include any specific reference to deaf children / sensory impairment?
	  Yes 
	  No

	
	X



Please include a copy of your eligibility criteria to access services whether or not this refers specifically to deaf children and young people. 
This Information is intended for future publication and therefore is exempt from release in line with S22 of the Act.  This letter acts as S17 refusal notice in respect of this part of your request.

4.2. Following an assessment of need do you apply eligibility criteria for assessed needs (e.g. Resource Allocation System (RAS) or other criteria)?
	Yes 
	  No

	X
	


If yes, please include a copy of your assessed eligible needs / RAS / other criteria in your response to this survey. 
4.3. Do you apply a means test to any services that you provide (e.g. if service users are in receipt of a disability benefit)?   
	Yes 
	  No

	
	X


4.4. If yes, please give details
	


4.5. For 2014/2015 have you restricted or altered your eligibility criteria / eligible needs to receive a social care service?  Please indicate in the details as to reasons for changes box if any changes refer to all disabled children or only deaf children.
                                   Yes         No           If yes, please give details as to reasons for changes
	Eligibility for a social care assessment 

	
	X
	

	Assessed Eligible Needs

	
	X
	


4.6. Will the eligibility criteria to access your team change with the introduction of the new Education Health and Care plans which are due to start in September 2014?
	Yes 
	  No

	
	X


4.7. If yes, please can you provide details of what the new criteria will be
NA
4.8. Comment box / additional information on this section 
NA
Section 5: Equipment / Assistive devices
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)
There are various assistive devices / equipment that social care can provide to support deaf children and young people at home and develop their independence. Assessments for this support fall within the duties under the Children Act 1989 s17 and provision of services falls within the Chronically Sick and Disabled Persons Act 1970 s2.

5.1 Does children’s social care have any arrangements in place to consider the possible equipment needs of deaf children at home / in the community? 

	Yes 
	  No

	X

	


If yes, please answer questions 5.2 to 5.13
If no, please go to question 5.13
5.2. Are deaf children’s possible needs for equipment offered within a statutory child in need section 17 assessment or are they undertaken as a specific (non-statutory) equipment assessment?
                                                       Please tick
	Part of 
statutory s17 assessment
	 X

	Specific non-statutory 
equipment assessment
	


5.3. If other arrangements are in place, please specify:

5.4. Who carries out the assessment of equipment needs?
                                                                       Please tick most relevant and state the name of the team
	Children’s social care 

	X

	Adult social care team

	

	Voluntary organisation (through a service level agreement with children’s social care)
	

	Other agency e.g. health/fire authority

	Hearing Impairment Service (Leicester City Council)


5.5. If you answered children’s social care above, is this person a social work professional or a children’s occupational therapist?
                                                Please tick 
	Social work professional

	X in conjunction with HI Team and Assistive Technology Worker

	Occupational therapist

	X


5.6. Is there a specific equipment budget in children’s social care for equipment provision?
	Yes 
	  No

	X

	


5.7. Does your local fire authority undertake an assessment / provision of equipment in terms of fire safety within the home (e.g. smoke alarms)? 
	Yes 
	  No

	?

	


5.8. Does the local fire authority issue / install any equipment?  
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
	Yes 
	  No

	
	


5.9. Are there any requirements for an assessment to be carried out before provision of any equipment?  
	Yes
	No

	?

	


5.10. If yes, please indicate below which items can be provided without an assessment or following an assessment:
Any equipment offered is assessed for.

There is a new facitlity for equipment for facilitate ‘preparing for adulthood’ but this is not yet operational. There has been very limited access to equipment and assessments to date.
	Equipment
	Provided without assessment
	Can only be provided following an assessment

	Vibrating alarm clock
	X
	

	Smoke alarm

	
	X

	Portable listening device (for TV, radio, etc.)
	X
	

	Portable or fixed alert for the door 
	X
	

	Amplified telephone
	X

	

	FM transmitter


	X
	

	Other – please specify

	
	


5.11. If a need for equipment has been identified, are parents / carers / young people offered an individual budget or direct payment in order to purchase equipment?
	Yes 
	  No

	
	X not at this time but this is being developed


5.12. Do you operate a separate waiting list for parents / carers who specifically request assessment for the provision of assistive devices / equipment to support their deaf child?
	Yes 
	  No

	
	X not at this time



5.13. Comment box / additional information on this section 
Section 6:  Written policies / local protocols / referral pathways
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)

6.1. Do you have any specific protocols / referral pathways for deaf children’s access to children’s social care services?
	 Yes 
	  No

	
	X



If yes please enclose a copy of these in your response to this survey
6.2. If yes at question 6.1, please tick which they cover:
                                                               



Please tick
	Early Support / Common Assessment                                                   
	

	Section 17 child in need assessments  
	

	Equipment assessment (CSDPA 1970 s2)
	

	Section 47 safeguarding investigations
	

	Other ( please state)                                                  
	


6.3. Do you have any protocols in place to use registered interpreters for children and young people whose first language is British Sign Language?
	Yes 
	  No

	X
	


6.4. If yes, please provide more information
If ‘translation services’ are needed these are accessed as any other translation services would be.
6.5. Are there any new protocols planned for how children’s social care will contribute to the forthcoming Education and Health Care plans in the Children and Families Act?  
 Please comment
	Yes 
	X
LCC has been a Pathfinder for SEND Reforms and we have developed guidance and policy


	No

	


6.6. Comment box / additional information on this section 
Section 7: Transitions
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)

7.1 Do you have a dedicated transitions worker who works with deaf young people? 

	Yes 
	  No

	
	X



7.2 Do social care staff routinely attend year 9 annual reviews on all deaf children and young people with educational statements (soon to be EHC plans)?
Please tick most appropriate 
	Yes, routinely

	 

	Only on active/open 
cases
	X however if a social care need is part of EHC Plan there will be attendance in the future

	No

	


7.3 If no, please state if there are any other arrangements in place, e.g. with other social care teams:
7.4. Comment box / additional information on this section 
Section 8: Multi-agency working
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)

Children’s Hearing Services Working Groups (CHSWG’s) are regular multi-agency forums where strategic providers of services to deaf children from statutory and non- statutory sectors and users of services meet to review and plan the provision and delivery of services to ensure services are effectively meeting local need; taking into consideration national policy and local protocols.
8.1 Does a representative from social care routinely attend the CHSWG meetings?
	Yes – regularly 
	Yes – occasionally
	  No

	
	
	X



8.2 Does any team manager or service managers responsible for this social care team have any other formal regular meetings with any other statutory / voluntary agencies (e.g. health, education, early years, etc.). This may be to discuss service planning/protocols with regular referrers to children’s social care, etc.
	Yes 
	  No

	
	X



8.3 If yes, please state what these are:
8.4 Comment box / additional information on this section 
Section 9: Training
These questions refer to the team that carries out the principle social care duties and functions with regards to deaf children and young people (i.e. the team identified in Q2.1)

9.1 Have staff in this social care team received deaf awareness training? 
	Yes
	  No

	X
	


9.2. If yes, is this mandatory for all the team members or only certain staff (e.g. frontline staff)?
	Yes (all)
	  No
	Certain staff (Please detail)

	
	X
	


9.3 Do staff in the social care team have specific safeguarding training on disabled children?
	Yes 
	  No

	X
	


.
9.4 Do staff outside the team in wider children’s social care have any training in deaf awareness? 
Training is available if required.
	Yes (all)
	  No
	Certain staff (Please detail)

	
	
	


9.5 If yes, is this mandatory or optional?
	Mandatory
	Optional

	X
	


Section 10: Information for parents / carers / young people
10.1 How can parents / carers / young people refer or request social care support?
Please detail
Phone City Duty and Advice Service
‘The Access Point’

Via requests for EHC Assessment from Sept 2014

Letters/emails

10.2 How can parents / carers find out about social care services for deaf children?
                                                  Please tick
	Leaflets
	

	Internet
	X

	DVD
	

	Local authority website
	X

	Other - please state

	Local Offer


10.3 Is any of this information in BSL (British Sign Language)?
	Yes 
	  No

	?
	


Please provide details
10.4 Do you have any plans in place to contribute information about accessing your services to inform the local offer under the Children and Families Act?
	Yes 
	  No

	X
	


10.5 If yes, please could you either describe and/or signpost to this information if it is available
Local offer website available.
Access to information through DAS/Disabled Children’s Services.
Thank you

This is the end of the survey. Thank you for very much for taking part. Please remember to include copies of the following in your response
· Eligibility criteria for referral into the service (see question 4.1)
· Eligibility criteria for assessed needs (e.g. RAS or other criteria) (see question 4.2)
· Specific protocols / referral pathways for deaf children’s access to children’s social care services (see question 6.1)

