Freedom of Information Act 2000 – council tax recovery action
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
If responding to any question in this request would exceed the section 12 cost limit, please respond "information not held" for that question and fulfil the remainder of this request. 

Impact on Claimants
1.      How many court summonses for non-payment of council tax were issued in the financial year 2012/13?
18,390
2.      How many working age Council Tax Benefit claimants had a court summons issued against them for non-payment of council tax in the financial year 2012/13?

Information not held.  This is a refusal notice under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act.

3.      How many liability orders were issued for non-payment of council tax in the financial year 2012/13?

13,880
4.      How many working age Council Tax Benefit claimants had a liability order issued against them for non-payment of council tax in the financial year 2012/13?

Information not held.  This is a refusal notice under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act.
5.      How many court summonses for non-payment of council tax were issued in the financial year 2013/14?

28,516
6.      How many working age Council Tax Support claimants had a court summons issued against them for non-payment of council tax in the financial year 2013/14?

7,086, (the figure quoted is for previously 100% Council Tax Benefit claimants only)

7.      Of those summonsed in 2013/14 in receipt of working age Council Tax Support, how many were charged court costs and what was the total amount of those costs?

7,086, (the figure quoted is for previously 100% Council Tax Benefit claimants only). Costs of £67.50 were charged for all cases with arrears of £250.00 and over and £40.00 for all cases with arrears from £40.00 to £249.99.  The total amount of those costs for 2013/14 were £1.215m.
8.      How many liability orders were issued for non-payment of council tax in the financial year 2013/14?

22,201
9.      How many working age Council Tax Support claimants had a liability order issued against them for non-payment of council tax in the financial year 2013/14?

4,773 (figure quoted is for previously 100% Council Tax Benefit cases only)

10.  Of those working age Council Tax Support claimants with a liability order issued against them in 2013/14, how many:

a.      had deduction from benefits requested?

2,542
b.      had deduction from earnings requested?

122

c.       had bailiffs engaged for enforcement?

41

d.      were already in debt to the council?

Information not held.  This is a refusal notice under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act.
Impact on Finances
1.      What is the total number of residents who had to pay more council tax under the authority's Council Tax Support Scheme in 2013/14 than they would have had to pay under the old national Council Tax Benefit?

16,654 cases were identified as receiving 100% Council Tax Benefit during a snapshot period in February 2013. Under the council’s local council tax reduction scheme they were required to pay a minimum of 20%

2.      How many of these residents were in arrears with their council tax at the end of the 2013/14 financial year? 

7,153

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House

9 – 15 Princess Road West
LEICESTER LE1 6TH 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
