Information requested
1. Children’s participation in local authority planning

1. What mechanisms are in place to support children’s participation in local authority service planning and commissioning in 2008, 2013 and 2014:

a. Children in care council

· total number of children participating

· break down of participants by age, gender, ethnicity, and special educational need or disability


In 2008 there was a participation group for Looked After Children (LAC) and Care 
Leavers called ‘Stand Up Speak Out’


It had 16 members, six females and ten males. Breakdown by age: three aged 20, 
three aged 19, three aged 18, two aged 17, three aged 16 and two aged 15. Two 
members were disabled.


In 2013 and 2014 there is a Children in Care Council (CICC) (called 450+ 
Voices). It has 
24 members, 14 females and 9 males. Breakdown by age: three aged 20, two aged 19, 
three aged 18, five aged 17, four aged 16, six aged 15 and one aged 12. Five of the 
members have physical or learning difficulties.

b. Children and youth forum

· total number of children participating

· break down of participants by age, gender, ethnicity, and special educational need or disability


Children and Youth Forum known locally as Young Peoples Council (See response to 


Q 1e   

c. Young Mayor

· Age, gender

No Young Mayor in Leicester City
d. Young citizens’ panel

· total number of children participating

· break down of participants by age, gender, ethnicity, and special educational need or disability

Young Citizens Panel known locally as Young Peoples Council (See response to 



Q 1e)   
Other [please specify] Young Peoples Council 

· total number of children participating
36
· break down of participants by age, gender, ethnicity, and special educational need or disability

Young Peoples Council Participants

Females:





Males


17yrs – Asian British – Indian


17 yrs - Asian British – Indian


16 years – Asian British – Indian (Disabled)
18 yrs - Asian British – Indian


21 yrs – Asian British – Indian

19 yrs - Asian British – Indian


21 yrs - Asian British – Indian


18 yrs – White British


17 ys - Asian British – Indian


19 yrs – Black British African


16 years - Asian British – Indian

19 yrs – Asian British Pakistani


15 yrs – White Other



18 yrs – White British (Dyslexic) 


16 yrs - Asian British – Indian


15 years - Asian British – Indian


18 yrs – White British



17 yrs - Asian British – Indian


18 yrs - Asian British – Indian


16 yrs – White British


19 yrs  – White British



20 yrs – White British


16 yrs  – White other



17 yrs - Asian British – Indian


18 yrs  – Black British African


19 yrs – Mixed other


16 yrs  – Black British African 

19 yrs – Black British African


20 yrs – White British (Disabled)

20 yrs – White British


18 yrs – Any other



18 yrs – Black British Caribbean 


18 yrs - Black American


21 yrs - Asian British – Indian


16 yrs - Asian British – Indian


21 yrs - Asian British – Indian

2. In 2008 and in 2013, how many times did the children in care council meet with:

a. A Councillor

b. The Director of Children’s Services

c. Other [please specify]
2008
a. 
Based on the information available, the CICC met with a councillor on at least 5 
occasions including involvement in a Stakeholder Conference and the Young 
People’s Council and attending a full Council meeting.

b. 
The CICC met once with the Director of Children’s Services (DCS) at the 
Stakeholder 
Conference and the DCS attended a social event with them.

c. 
The CICC met with a Head of Children’s Services, the Chief Executive of the 
Council, the Children’s Rights Director and the Lord Mayor. Senior Managers 
attended a social event with them. In addition they visited a range of Services 
including YOS, fostering and RALAC (Raising Achievement of LAC)

2013 - 14
a.
Based on the information available, the CICC met with a Councillor on at least 10 
occasions with the Lead Member attending their meetings, CICC members 
attending Corporate Parenting Forum and attendance at Scrutiny to present their 
annual 
report. Also the Lead Member attended a number Participation Events organised by the 
CICC. 

b.
The Interim DCS attended one CICC meeting in 2013

c.
There are senior managers at each CICC meeting (monthly). E.g. Heads of 
Service and other senior managers attend meetings for specific agenda items, for 
example in 2013 they came to discuss the budget position and the proposals for 
Service re-design and the implications for LAC and Care Leavers. CICC members 
meet senior managers from across the Council when they attend Corporate Parenting 
Forum (quarterly). CICC members meet with members of parliament at the All Party 
Parliamentary Group. (Three times in 2013). Senior Managers attend Participation 
Events organised by the CICC (three in 2013)

3. In 2008 and in 2013, how many times did the children and youth forum or young citizens’ panel meet with: In respect of the Young people’s Council.
a. A Councillor  A total of 27 in 2013.
b. The Director of Children’s Services 
Twice in 2013. 
Information for 2008 is not held, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
c. Other [please specify]



2. Youth services and facilities budget

1. What was/is the local authority budget in 2008-9, 2013-14 and 2014-15 for:

a. Youth service
2008/09
£3.5m

2013/14
£3.7m

2014/15
£3.4m
i.   How much is allocated to targeted youth support
2008/09
Unable to differentiate from total budget

2013/14
£507k

2014/15
£462k

b. Youth facilities, for example youth clubs
2008/09
£229k

2013/14
£207k

2014/15
£81k

2. What was/is the budget for youth services and facilities as a percentage of the local authority’s overall budget in 2008-9, 2013-14 and 2014-15


2008/09
1.33%
2013/14
1.24%

2014/15
1.15%


3. Play services and facilities budget

1. What was/is the local authority budget in 2008-9, 2013-14 and 2014-15 for:

a. Play services

b. Play facilities, for example outdoor play spaces
a.   Play Services
2008/09
£1m
2013/14
£1m
2014/15
£1m

The play budget is not split between services and facilities

2. What was/is the budget for play services and facilities as a percentage of the local authority’s overall budget in 2008-9, 2013-14 and 2014-15.
2008/09
0.41%

2013/14
0.35%

2014/15
0.35%



4. Local authority expenditure on advocacy services for children and young people

1. What was the local authority budget for advocacy services for children and young people in 2008/9 and 2013/14? What was this as a percentage of the total LA budget?
2008/09
£72k

2013/14 
£94k

The Advocacy budget is not split between children and children in care.

2. What was the local authority budget for advocacy services for children in care and care leavers in 2008/9 and 2013/14? What was this as a percentage of the total LA budget?

2008/09
0.03%
2013/14 
0.03%


5. Local authority policy on Council Tax support for low-income families with dependent children

1. Does the local authority have in place a policy regarding charging Council Tax to low-income families with dependent children? If so, please send a copy, or provide a link, to the policy with this FOI response.

‘Low income’ refers to: Free School Meal eligibility, ie, those in receipt of Income Support, Income-based Jobseekers Allowance, Income-related Employment and Support Allowance, or Child Tax Credit.

The link to the relevant policies is http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/housing/council-tax/ways-to-reduce-your-bill/council-tax-reduction-scheme/
2. Please provide:

a. The number and proportion of low-income families with dependent children in the local authority area who paid Council Tax in 2013/14. 

b. The number and proportion of low-income families with dependent children in the local authority area who were asked to pay these amounts in 2013/14:

i. Less than £100

ii. Between £100 to £200

iii. Between £200 to £300

iv. More than £300

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice 
under 
section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 
1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.


