Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 I seek the following information about your libraries. Please send me:

1. The total number of books on loan from your libraries which are overdue.
ANSWER:  126,248.  This represents around 0.6% of the total number of books borrowed over the 12 year period of our data.
2. The total number of those books which are overdue by more than 5 weeks.
114,450

3. The total number of those books which are overdue by more than 12 weeks.
107,700

4. The total fines on books currently overdue from your libraries.
This information is not available as no fines exist on the system or elsewhere until the items are returned.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. The maximum possible overdue fine on a book loaned from one of your libraries, and the time period after which that maximum is reached.
The maximum possible fine is £3.00 for adult members aged between 18yrs – 59yrs. The maximum charge is incurred after 12 library open days.
6. The total number of overdue books on which the maximum fine is owed.
As fines information is not available on our systems or elsewhere until the items are returned, it is difficult for us to know on which of the books the maximum fine is owed. And also as different borrower category types attract different concessions and charges, we are unable to give you a total number.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
7. The total estimated value of all the books currently overdue from your libraries.
The Council does not hold information on the total estimated value of all the overdue books.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
8. The name of the book which is the longest overdue, and how long it is overdue by.
Secret life of Laszlo, Count Dracula by Anscombe, Roderick

Due date: 15/04/02

9. The number of libraries you run.
16

10. Which year your council's library records date back to - i.e. over how many years have you been collecting the information which has been used to answer the above questions?
2002 

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance Team

Leicester City Council
Bosworth House

9-15 Princess Road West

Leicester , LE1 6TH

e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
