Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
The FOI request is about a Fosse Court residential care home, 207-211 Fosse Road North, Leicester, LE3 5EZ. This was contracted with you until the contract was recently withdrawn.

1. How many contract monitoring visits were undertaken at the above residential home since December 2012 until it closed in July 2014?
2 - 9/05/2014 and 21/05/2014

2. Were these announced or unannounced visits?
1 announced 1 unannounced.
3. Were there any sanctions placed on the home following any of these visits?
No

4. How many people were placed in Fosse Court by the city council since December 2012? 
25

5. How many people were female / male?
In June 2014 there were 11 female and 5 male service users in the care home.
6. Of the people placed what was their first choice spoken language? 
There was a mixture of English/Gujarati/Punjabi/Hindi languages spoken by Service Users.
7. How many of those people had a language appropriate social worker / person who arranged the placement? 
As some of the staff members who placed residents no longer work for Leicester City Council we are not able to establish the language spoken during placement. Of the staff still working in the service area we can confirm that out of 7 placements 6 residents had a language appropriate social worker and 1 sought the services of an independent translator.
8. Of those placed, how many visits did they receive following their care commencing in the home. 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
9. Of those placed how many had visits from an employee of the council to review their care and their care plan.

12 visits from Care Management, phone calls to the home and 2 visits from Contracts & Assurance Service. 

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House 
Ground Floor

9 – 15 Princess Road West 
LEICESTER LE1 6TH
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.ico.org.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

