Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I wish to make a series of separate requests under the Act.  For convenience, I am including them in the same email.  

1. Please confirm the total number of complaints received concerning sick, dying or dead puppies (6 months old or under) in: a) 2011, b) 2012 and c) 2013. 
ANSWER:  None. Apart from the case below, where a sick dog was presented to a vet, but this was not reported to us due to the dog being sick but because the dog had been identified as an illegal landing. 
2. Please confirm in the last three years how many illegal landings of puppies have you received?
Two
In case 1 – a dog was presented to a vet for inoculation with a false passport from Portugal.  The vet reported it to Leicester City Council and allowed the owner to remove the dog. The Council visited and arranged for the dog to be quarantined by an authorised quarantine premise and carrying agent. 
In case 2 – a sick dog was presented to a vet with a false passport and was identified as an illegal landing from Romania.  The vet reported it to the Council; however, we were unable to trace the owner/dog at the address. 
3. Please confirm, where known, by what means are the sick puppies you encounter acquired? List all that apply: 
We have not encountered any sick puppies other than as Trading Standards detailed in question 2. 
A. Pet shop

B. Licensed breeder

C. Unlicensed breeder

D. Casual acquisition - pub, friend had a litter etc.

E. Rescue
Not Applicable
4. Please confirm how many puppies have been seized by your team in trading standards in: a) 2011 b) 2012 c) 2013.
None
5. Please confirm what legislation was used to seize the puppies? [please list all that applies]
Not applicable

6. Please confirm how many prosecutions have been made by your trading standards as a result of missold or dying puppies in: a) 2011 b) 2012 c) 2013.
None
7. Please confirm where the majority of the puppies seized in 2013 originate from?

A. Imported from Ireland

B. Imported from EU countries

C. Other (please specify)  
Not applicable

8. Please confirm how concerned the local authority is that the import of puppies from the continent could expose the UK to a significant risk of rabies?

A. Very concerned

B. Concerned

C. Unconcerned
      We do not consider this to be a significant risk in Leicester  

9. Please confirm if the local authority has plans and facilities in place for the isolation of puppies if a shipment of sick puppies is discovered?
Yes we have procedures in place to make arrangements. If an illegal shipment of sick puppies was discovered then we would alert the Animal and Plant Health Agency, and contact an authorised quarantine premise and carrying agent to collect the dogs.  We do not have facilities to hold illegal dogs whether healthy or sick. 

10. Please confirm whether the local authority believes there is a growing problem with underage, sick or dying puppies being illegally imported into the UK? 

A. Yes

B. No

C. Don’t know
No
11. Please confirm whether the local authority believes that the current penalties for importing puppies illegally are harsh enough to act as a deterrent for puppy traders? 
A. Yes

B. No

C. Don't know
Imported puppies have not been identified as a significant threat in Leicester and therefore we are unable to comment as to whether the penalties are or are not a deterrent.
12. Please confirm what the local authority believes should be done to try and stop puppy traffickers, both in terms of legislation and enforcement?
Sharing of information and multi-agency interventions based on intelligence
13. Please provide any case studies/anecdotes which you feel represent the concerns around bad breeding and the rise in illegal imports of puppies and the associated welfare problems.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance Team

Leicester City Council
Bosworth House

9-15 Princess Road West

Leicester, LE1 6TH

E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

