Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Please provide a figure for the number of noise complaints you have received for the following financial years: 2011-12, 2012-13, 2013-14
2. For each of these financial years, please provide a breakdown of the noise complaints you have received into the following categories:

a) Loud music or party

b) Loud voices

c) Car alarm or house alarm

d) Pet noise

e) Baby crying

f) DIY noise

g) Nightclub or pub

h) Roadworks or noise from construction sites outside of allowed hours

i) Slamming doors

j) Other

If you do not hold the information broken down into these categories then please provide the information broken down by the categories your council uses.

Where an individual has made several complaints about the same issue, please record these as separate complaints, if your recording system will allow you to do so.

Please provide the information in an excel spreadsheet or another machine readable format.
ANSWER:  

Please find attached spreadsheet with the number of noise complaints received. Leicester City Council do not record them in the categories requested, and we would not be able to break it down further. 

The following Categories are given in the attached spreadsheet that the Council uses:

a) Total number of noise complaints

b) Number of loud music complaints

c) Number of banging/bumping etc. complaints

d) Number of Alarm complaints

e) Number of DIY complaints

f) Number of entertainment noise complaints

g) Number of construction noise complaints

h) Other complaints (which is all the rest minus the categories above)
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance Team

Leicester City Council
Bosworth House

9-15 Princess Road West

Leicester, LE1 6TH

E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

