
Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. I want to see the audit trail of design documentation that led to the implementation of the shared space for pedestrians and cyclists. 

a. That will include the layout of the shared space right the way through the junction including the placement of every sign post, lamp post, bus stop, electronics box and drain cover. 

Answer:

There is no separate design audit trail for the cycle facility. 
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

b. It will include the timings of all the traffic lights that affect cyclists and pedestrians and the consideration given to their safety and convenience.

The traffic light timings in this area 
The attached plan number HT/106433P/L(0)/961shows the layout of the junction including the phasing of the traffic signals. The allocated times for the peak hours are as follows:
Morning peak:

Cycle time 120 seconds

Phase J = 43 seconds
Phase K = 6 seconds
Phase L = 53 seconds
Phase M = 56 seconds
Phase N = 67 seconds
Phase O = 43 seconds
Phase P = 29 seconds
Phase Q = 44 seconds
Evening Peak:

Cycle time 120 seconds

Phase J = 40 seconds
Phase K = 6 seconds
Phase L = 55 seconds
Phase M = 59 seconds
Phase N = 65 seconds
Phase O = 40 seconds
Phase P = 26 seconds
Phase Q = 53 seconds
2. I want to see the safety audits of the design and of the implementation. Especially the safety audit that was carried out on 27/11/2013 which I saw happening, spoke to the engineers and wrote about it here: http://42bikes.warnock.me.uk/2013/11/27/leicester-city-council-safety-audit-failure/  this is the safety audit that I have been told the Council cannot share with me because Sainsbury's have copyright of them. I have checked this with other Engineers at other Councils and been told that it has to be publicly available.
Stage 1, 2 and 3 safety audits enclosed.
Some personal information has been removed.

We are withholding that information since we consider that to be an absolute exemption under section 40(2) (personal data), and this therefore constitutes a refusal under section 17 of the Freedom of information Act 2000.

3. I want to see everything about any design or review of the posts that are still in the middle of the cycle route and which I was promised on 27/11/2014 by the Sainsbury's representative would be removed.

The post in the middle of the cycle route has been reviewed as part of the stage 3 audit report (attached) safety audit item 4.6 and the remedial measure suggested to move them.  

4. I want to see the correspondence about how this junction should be signposted for cyclists (for example there is zero signs telling northbound cyclists which way to go).

This item has been reviewed as part of stage-3 safety audit item no: 4.10 and remedial measure suggested to sign post it.  Please see attached audit report stage 3. 
5. I want any documents/emails relating to the public comments about the junction.

Public consultation was carried out by Sainsbury’s on this development and this information is held by them. The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House

9 – 15 Princess Road West
LEICESTER LE1 6TH 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

