Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked: 

Please can I request an environmental health search for the below:

7-9 Gallowtree Gate, Leicester, LE1 5AD
1. Has the site been identified for inspection or further review under the Council's Contaminated Land Strategy (or other Part IIA undertaking)? If so, please describe the priority status/risk ranking of the site and the likely timescale for any further scrutiny of the site.
ANSWER:  No inspection of the above property has been undertaken, pursuant to the above mentioned strategy at any point. The City Council has no immediate plans to investigate the site nor holds any definite information to justify raising the risk potential of this site above that of numerous other sites in its area.  

2. Are there any known contamination issues associated with the site or in the near vicinity e.g. in terms of former or current contaminative site uses, leaks or spills of any oil/chemical substances etc.? If there have been any intrusive investigations at the site or near vicinity, please provide dates and titles of any reports and confirm whether the reports are publicly available.
No inspection of the above property has been undertaken, therefore none known.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Please provide the following details of any current or former landfills located within a 250m radius of the site:

a) The location of all landfills, both closed and operational (i.e. National Grid Reference and location plan if available).

b) Dates when the landfill was operational.

c) Types of waste deposited.

d) Any information on volume of waste deposited, depth of infilling and landfill structure.

e) Details of any landfill gas monitoring, site investigation or gas spiking undertaken at the landfill or in the immediate vicinity of the site.
There are no known landfill sites within 250m radius of the site.

4. Are there any known current or former nuisance issues, prosecutions or enforcements associated with the site or adjoining properties, e.g. noise, odour or dust issues/complaints?  If yes, what was the nature of the issue and what was the outcome?
There are no known current or former issues relating to nuisance at this location. 

5. Are there any known private water supplies recorded on your Local Authority Private Water Supply Register, within 2km radius of the site? If yes what is the location (i.e. NGR), the source of abstraction and its purpose?
We hold no records of any private water abstraction within 2km radius of the property.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
6. Do you hold any records of flooding at the subject site?
Information on flooding should be referred to Environment Agency.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
7. Please provide details of any LAAPC/LAPPC authorisations licensed to the site or to adjoining properties.
No known LAAPC/LAPPC activities are permitted on or adjacent to the site.

Are there any records of petroleum storage at or in the immediate vicinity of the site, either in above ground or below ground tanks?
There are no known records of petroleum storage at the above site or in the immediate vicinity.

If yes:

1. How many tanks were there and what was their capacity? Please provide a plan showing the tank locations if possible

2. How long were the tanks in use/known to be present on site?

3. What is the current status of the tanks? If they have been decommissioned by filling, please detail fill material.

4. Are there any known leaks or spills associated with the tanks?

5. Are there any records of integrity testing? If so when was this undertaken and what were the results?
Questions 1 – 5 are not applicable.

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance Team

Leicester City Council
Bosworth House

9-15 Princess Road West

Leicester, LE1 6TH

E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
