
Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I would like to request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000:

1. Does the council conduct any form of surveillance? Yes/No. If so:
Answer:

Yes.
2. Which departments / teams undertake surveillance activity? e.g. trading standards, corporate fraud, licencing, environmental health, community safety, HR / Audit, Anti Social Behaviour, Benefit Fraud etc?
This question requires some clarification.  If you could be specific on what type of surveillance you would like the answers for, and what you mean by activity, I can look at gathering what information the Council holds for this question.  Leicester City council deals with various types of surveillance, and activity is too broad a description in this instance.
Once you have clarified we will be able to reconsider your request.  If this clarification is not received within three months your request will be considered to have lapsed.  Under section 1(3) of the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), a public authority need not comply with a request unless any further information reasonably required to locate the information is supplied.

3. When was the last time your local authority was inspected by the Office of Surveillance Commissioners (OFC) to ensure compliance with legislation?
25th July 2012 was our last inspection by the Office of Surveillance Commissioners.
4. When is your Local Authority next due an inspection (if known)?
Leicester City Council has not had any notification of the next inspection by the OSC.

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Who is the main council contact for inspections? Please provide their job title, name, e-mail address and phone number.

Andy Keeling, Chief Operating Officer.

andy.keeling@leicester.gov.uk
0116 4540101

The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House

9 – 15 Princess Road West
LEICESTER LE1 6TH 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

