Freedom of Information Act 2000 – council tax collection policies
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
“Please find attached an FOI request, to be treated under the Freedom of Information Act, exploring local authority debt collection practice.  The FOI focuses specifically on the collection of council tax arrears and the impact of council tax collection policies on children.  

The Children’s Society will use the information in this FOI, alongside interviews with families and an online survey of parents and children, to understand the impact that council tax debts have on families with children, and to develop practical policy recommendations. We will publish a public report on this issue in March 2015. 

We appreciate that some of the information may be challenging to collate and so thank you in advance for your time and effort.  We would also be interested to hear from councils with examples good practice they would like to highlight as this will form a key part of the final published report.”
1. Provide the number of households (a) overall and (b) with children that were in arrears on their council tax on the 31st March for each of the following years. 
	
	2013-14
	2012-13
	2011-12

	Total number of households liable for council tax in your local authority
	130,992
	129,875
	128,494

	Number of households with children in your local authority
	Information not held as it is not required in order to calculate Council Tax liability 
	Information not held as it is not required in order to calculate Council Tax liability
	Information not held as it is not required in order to calculate Council Tax liability

	Number of individual households in Council Tax arrears 
	10,162*
	10,945*
	18,380*

	Number of individual households in Council tax arrears with children 
	Information not held. In order to calculate Council Tax liability, only data relating to adults aged 18 and over is required and data related to children is not collected 
	Information not held. In order to calculate Council Tax liability, only data relating to adults aged 18 and over is required and data related to children is not collected
	Information not held. In order to calculate Council Tax liability, only data relating to adults aged 18 and over is required and data related to children is not collected


*number of accounts at reminder stage or beyond as at 31st March – please note that an individual household may have more than one account as a new account reference is given when there is a change of address/circumstances

We do not hold the number of households with children and the number of individual households in Council tax arrears with children.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

2. When a household loses the right to pay their council tax by instalments, does the council have a policy to: 

(a) allow an individual to negotiate for instalments to be reinstated   

(b) allow an individual to negotiate affordable repayments 

(c) signpost to debt advice services before a court summons is sent

(d) signpost to debt advice services after the summons is sent but before the court hearing

(e) signpost to debt advice services once a liability order has been granted

(f) other (please explain)

All options are available to staff including making a mutually agreeable arrangement to pay.  Staff are fully aware of the options to refer individuals to debt advice services at any recovery stage (including Money Advice, Citizens Advuce Bureau and Clockwise, a local Credit Union) and these options are also advertised on all our recovery documents.  We also offer help through our discretionary fund for Council Tax and/or refer cases to the council’s Single Point of Contact team. 
3. Do you have specific council tax arrears collection practice for households with children under 18? Please explain how this differs from standard practice and send us any relevant policies. 

No specific policy. 
4. How many individual (a) households and (b) households with children under 18 have been issued with a court summons  in each of the last three financial years (2013/12, 2012/13, 2011/12)?  

	2011-12
	2012-13
	2013-14

	19,982
	18,390
	28,516


Information regarding households with children under 18 is not held.  Therefore this acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

5. Please complete the table below, showing when liability orders have been granted for households within your local authority in the last three financial years.

	
	2011-12
	2012-13
	2013-14

	Number of liability orders granted 
	19,982
	18,390
	28,516

	Number of liability orders granted for households with children 
	19,982
	18,390
	28,516


6. Please complete the table below, showing how liability orders have been used for households within your local authority in the last three financial years.   If the answers are not known for number of households with children please indicate this and provide for the number of households overall.

Figures are not held for the number of households with children. 

	
	2011-12
	2012-13
	2013-14

	Number of households with children that an attachment of earnings order has been made
	3,475
	4,379
	4,976

	Number of households with children that a deductions from benefits order has been made
	3,009
	3,783
	9,262

	Number of households with children that have been referred to bailiffs
	9,291
	9,631
	11,260

	Number of households with children where proceedings have started for a committal to prison 
	0
	0
	15


7. How many of the referrals to bailiffs have resulted in the removal of goods for (a) all households and (b) all households with children 

No goods were removed in any of the three financial years.

8. Council Tax Support Scheme

	How many households within your local authority received 100% subsidy for council tax in 2012/13?
	29,304

	How many households within your local authority received 100% subsidy for council tax in 2013/14?
	10,075

	For non pensioner households with children what was the maximum percentage of their council tax bill that could be covered by council tax support?
	80%


The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House

9 – 15 Princess Road West
LEICESTER LE1 6TH 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 
Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
