Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

i. Do staff receive training on issues pertaining to radicalisation and extremism? 

Yes


ii. Is this training provided by an external body? If so who? If it is provided internally please state which department conducts it? 

Training is provided at different levels and uses a combination of internal workforce development trainers and external providers. The external provider is currently The St Philips Centre.


iii. What month and year did such training first start? 
iv. How many staff received such training and what percentage of staff received such training in 2010, 2011, 2012, 2013 and 2014.

v. Please provide all training documentation utilised? 

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

vi. Please provide a list of extremist thoughts, ideas, views, behaviours, influences and outlooks which such training advises has the potential to radicalise and which inform your working practices. 

Training encompasses all forms of extremism from far right, extreme right wing and faith based ideologies.


vii. Please provide a list of organisations, groups and individuals which you consider to be extreme or support/preach extremism, including any lists you keep for the purposes of advice or enforcement. 

For your information this constitutes as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, e.g. it is already in the public domain.
A list of proscribed organisations can be found here: 
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/proscribed-terror-groups-or-organisations--2
A definition of extremism can be found in the revised 2011 Prevent strategy: 
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/prevent-strategy-2011
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information and Support
Leicester City Council

Bosworth House

9 – 15 Princess Road West
LEICESTER LE1 6TH 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.
