Freedom of Information Act 2000 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Does your Council Publish a List of Public Health Funerals it has carried out?
ANSWER:  Yes copy attached. Re-construction of the website means that currently this information is not available online.
2. How often is this late updated (Including the last time it was updated)?
Every 3 months.  The attached spreadsheet was last updated on 16th April 2015 but is yet to be published.

3. Does the Council have any Public Health Funeral cases on record that are not presently published on the website?
Yes but all of the cases are on the attached spreadsheet, these will be published as soon as the re-construction of the site is complete.
4. If the answer to question 3 is Yes, what are their details (including names, last known address, date of birth, date of death, date of funeral, and whether the case has been/ will be/ or even might be referred to the Treasury Solicitor? 
Please see the attached spreadsheet for this information.
I confirm that we do have the full address of the deceased, however this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 31 of the Act is being applied – law enforcement

Disclosure of the requested information would be likely to have significant negative impact on the prevention of crime. The Council considers there is a strong public interest in avoiding likely prejudice to the prevention of crime.
The Council does not hold all of the dates of when each funeral took place. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Has the Council given any of this information away to another individual or organization (either formally through an FOI request or informally through other communications? 

Yes, formally through an FOIA request. 
6. What is the name, email and telephone number of the individual(s) responsible for overseeing public health funerals within the Council? 
Malcolm Grange
Head of Regulatory Service
Email: - Malcolm.Grange@leicester.gov.uk 

Tel: (0116) 454 3111

7. What is the name, email and telephone number of the individual(s) responsible for overseeing Treasury Solicitor referrals within the Council?
Same as above for Q6
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 

Information Governance Manager
Information Governance 

Leicester City Council
1st Floor, 16 New Walk
Leicester, LE1 6UB
E-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

