Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Discretionary Housing Payments
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. What was the council's total DHP budget (spent and unspent) for the

2014-2015 financial year?
	Total
	£828,533.00
	100%

	Spent
	£828,533.00
	100%

	Total
	           -
	0.0%


The processing of all claims received prior to 31st March 2015 is not yet complete, therefore the final spend figure has not yet been finalised. Therefore this part of the letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Informaton Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

Based on the outstanding application count however, it is anticipated that the final spend will total the government contribution and the outstanding balance has been allocated for this purpose.

2. How many individual DHP awards were made by the council in the

2014-2015 allocations year?

No. of Awards
2,473

No. of Customers
1,713

3. What percentage of the council's total DHP funding for 2014-2015 was paid out in awards?
Please see 1 above

4. Local reasons why DHPs were allocated

a) Please send a list of all DHP awards made in the 2014-2015 year.

Where possible, this list should include the:

i) reason for each award (for example, the award was made to cover bedroom tax, or to meet rent costs in excess of the benefit cap).

ii) duration of each award (for example, one month, six months, one year)

iii) size of the award - how much money was awarded in each case

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
As not all claims have yet been awarded the information supplied is based on the claims details for 88% of the awards as at 31.3.15.  It is not possible on the basis of this dataset to determine lengths of awards.
5. Averages/median payouts and length of payout

a) What was the most common length of a DHP award in the 2014-2015 year? (For example, one month, six months, a year.)

13 Weeks

b) What was the most common reason for the longest awards in 2014-2015?

Removal of Spare Room Subsidy

c) What was the most common/median amount for a DHP award in 2014-2015?
The ‘most common’ or 'mode' DHP award, is not a valuable statistic – all awards are assessed based on individual circumstances and vary significantly. The mode is £1,161.23, which had three awards of precisely this amount.

The median DHP award was £310.27. The mean DHP award was £470.46.
6) How long on average does it take the council to process a DHP application?
50.27 Days

7. Other questions

a) Is DLA/PIP counted as income in calculations to DHP entitlement? If Yes, which DLA/PIP components are included?

In respect of 2014/15, all elements of DLA/PIP have been included as income, counterbalanced by also taking into account the expenses relating to the disability. This policy is currently under review.

b) How can people apply for a DHP from the council? Please send any application forms and links to form pages, and any online application instructions.
Customers may obtain a paper form from our offices, or download a form online, to complete and return by post or hand.

This form can be downloaded from http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-community/benefits-and-support/housing-benefit/discretionary-housing-payments
An online form in currently under development. 

c) Do people have to complete an application form to apply? Please note if there are any other means by which people can apply (for example, can they just send an email detailing their requirements).

Yes, they have to complete an application form and provide all relevant evidence to support their application.

d) Please include contact email address(s) and telephone numbers for people wanting to make DHP applications and to find out more information.

E-mail address for Enquiries is Housing.benefit@leicester.gov.uk
Telephone Number for Enquiries is 0116 4541006
Web address for more info = http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-community/benefits-and-support/housing-
The legislation allows you to use the information supplied for your own personal use, or for journalistic purposes. If the information is a dataset (which does not relate to the environment), you may also use the information for commercial re-use under use under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please write to: 
Information Governance Manager
Information Governance
City Barrister & Head of Standards
1st Floor
16 New Walk
LEICESTER LE1 6UB 
e-mail: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk 

Your request for internal review should be submitted to the above address within 40 (forty) working days of receipt by you of this response.  Any such request received after this time will only be considered at the Council’s absolute discretion.

You may also seek independent advice from the Information Commissioner at: 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow SK9 5AF 

Telephone: 01625 545 700 

www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
Please be aware that the Information Commissioner does not normally consider requests until the internal appeals process of the Council has been exhausted.  You are therefore advised to appeal to the Information Governance Manager before contacting the Commissioner.

